Station 1
8130 3" Street
Wellington, CO 80549

Station 2
108 W County Road 66
Fort Collins, CO 80524

Wellington Fire Protection District
REGULAR BOARD MEETING AGENDA
Revised.2

The Regular Board Meeting of the Wellington Fire Protection District will be called to order on
November 19, 2025 at 5:00PM following the Public Hearing on the proposed FY2026 Budget at 4:00PM. The
meeting will be held at Station 1 located at 8130 3™ St, Wellington, CO 80549. Please contact
our administrative office for any attendance accommodation. Zoom Meeting information is listed below.

Pledge of Allegiance

Roll Call

Additions/Deletions to the Agenda
Conflicts of Interest
Correspondence

Public Comment
Any property owner, business owner, or resident of the District that would like to comment on items not
listed on the agenda may be restricted to a 3-minute limit per person.

Employee Recognition
Guests or Presentations

Consent Agenda
e Regular Board Meeting Minutes for October 8, 2025

Chief’s Report

Monthly Activity Report
Employee Report
Committee Reports
Monthly Financial Report
District Business

e |FC 2024 Fire Code Adoption
e Discussion of Board of Director Vacancy
e Discussion of Sale of Property

P.0.BOX 10, Wellington, CO 80549 | (970) 568-3232 | www.WFPD.org



Station 1
8130 3" Street
Wellington, CO 80549

Station 2
108 W County Road 66
Fort Collins, CO 80524

Wellington Fire Protection District

Other

e CBA Tentative Agreement- Review only per Resolution 2025-003

Calendar Items
Next Board Meeting

e Regular Board Meeting - December 10, 2025 at Station 1

Adjournment

Wellington Fire Protection District Zoom
Meeting information

Join Zoom Meeting
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/7848079463
Meeting ID: 784 807 9463
+ 17209289299,7848079463# US (Denver)

P.0. BOX 10, Wellington, CO 80549 | (970) 568-3232 | www.WFPD.org



Wellington Fire Protection District

Station 1, 8130 34 Street, Wellington, CO 80549

October 8th, 2025, BOARD MEETING MINUTES

Call to Order & Pledge of Allegiance

e Time Called to Order: 17:02

e Pledge of Allegiance: Conducted.

e Roll Call: Directors: Bollinger, Hodgson, Amicarella and Standing were present.
Unexcused Absence: Director Hunter

Additions or Deletions to the Agenda
e No additions or deletions. One addendum was included in the packet.

Conflicts of Interest

e None
Correspondence
e None

Public Comment

e No public comment

Employee Recognition

o Firefighter Hook was recognized for achieving Fire Instructor I certification.

Consent Agenda (Meeting Minutes)

Director Hodgson made the motion, to approve the Regular Board Meeting minutes from
September 10, 2025. Motion was seconded by Director Amicarella and passed unanimously
on a vote 4/0.



Chief’s Report — Operational Updates
Grant Updates:

District awarded EMTS grant funding for a rescue boat, UTV, trailer, and 10
portable radios.

Process: District purchases equipment, then receives 50% reimbursement.

Trailer received; UTV due this week; boat is in route.

Portable radios totaled $87,000 (originally quoted for 10 Motorola radios). After
price increases, alternative manufacturer Bendix (BK) selected — allows purchase
of 16 radios for same cost, though grant reimburses only for 10. District will
purchase the additional 6 with its own funds.

Total of 16 new portables will replace outdated equipment.

Staffing:

Two new hires started September 10, 2025. District now fully staffed.
Both new hires are working through probationary task books.
Hiring list has been exhausted; new testing will be required for future vacancies.

Monthly Activity Report

Total calls: 114 (YTD: 901)

Fire & Other Services: 40 (YTD: 310)
EMS: 69 (YTD: 528)

Motor Vehicle Accidents: 5 (YTD: 63)

Notable Incidents:

September 11 — Structure Fire, Gateway Crossing: Reported victim trapped; all
occupants safely evacuated, smoke inhalation treated. Two PFA engines assisted.
Investigation is ongoing with state and county.

September 6 — Motor Vehicle Accident: T-bone collision; non-life-threatening
injuries; units remained for lighting and traffic control.

Fleet Update

Captain Schneeberger reported:

Fleet expenses stabilized after large repairs were done.
Engine 92 scheduled for transmission replacement in January 2026.
Fleet operating within budget.

Training:

All shifts completed live-fire training at Loveland.
Four firefighters will complete make-up sessions (two new hires, two on injury
leave).



Committee Reports
Sales Tax Ballot Update:

Progress continues with Larimer County; item appeared in budget books.
Staff preparing voter lists.

Financial Report Highlights (By David Green)

General Summary:

94% of revenue collected year-to-date; Wildland reimbursements pending.
Personnel costs: 73% | Operating expenses: 71%.
Overall budget remains ~4% under for the year.

Discussion Highlights:

Salaries for staffing vacancies were offset by overtime.

Wildland salary reimbursements delayed 6-8 months by the state.

Wildland operations expected to net positive due to equipment reimbursement.
No major variances and no amendments needed unless extraordinary expenses
arise.

District Business

2026 PRELIMINARY BUDGET DISCUSSION

Revenues up by $91,000 (growth within district).

Includes plan to rebate full historical tax payment ($232,000) to taxpayers, clearing
a long-outstanding item.

Only remaining debt after repayment: new engine.

Salaries increased 9% (includes 5% COLA & FPPA rate increased)

Increased IT budget (+$17,000) for service costs; election costs reduced (-$54,000).
Contingency line removed; redistributed among various line items.

Capital debt decreased as several leases were retired.

Projected year-end change in fund balance shows an increase of $60,303 which will
go towards future capital outlay.

Ballot not factored into this budget.

Public budget hearing scheduled for November, with formal approval in
December.

CONSIDERATION OF VEHICLE PURCHASE — 2017 TYPE 6 WILDLAND ENGINE

Brighton Fire selling a 2017 Type 6 (7,000 miles). Upgrading their fleet.

Asking price: $110,000; negotiated purchase to $105,000.

Would replace the 2004 Type 6 we currently have, which is scheduled for
replacement in 2027.

Don’t have the room or personnel to keep both.

New Type 6 = $275K-$285K.

May fund through capital reserves; potential offset by sale of 2004 (~$25K value).



Director Bollinger made the motion 1o purchase the 2017 Type 6 for $105,000. Motion was
seconded by Direcior Hodgson and passed unanimously on avote 4/0.

Chief Germain will create Resolution for the purchase.

Other
Tent Permits & Fire Code Update:

» Updated tent inspection procedure: self-inspection for tents 2,400 sq. ft. or less.

» Larger tents require engineering report and district review.

o District to adopt 2024 International Fire Code (IFC) next month; replacing 2018
version.

 Amendments updated by fire protection engineer; minimal changes, mostly ali gning
with base code.

* Public review and adoption planned for next board meeting; coordinated with Town
of Wellington.

Calendar and Miscellaneous

¢ Regular Monthly Board Meeting: November 19, 2025 at 1700 hours, WF PD,
Station 1.

Adjournment

Director Amicarella made the motion to adjourn at 17:56. Motion was seconded by
Director Standing and passed unanimously on a vote of 4/0.

Director Denny Hodgson, Secretary/Clerk



WELLINGTON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

MONTHLY SERVICE
ACTIVITY

October 2025
TOTAL INCIDENT ACTIVITY: 97 YTD: 998
Fire and Other Services: 31 YTD: 341 EMS Responses: 62 YTD: 590
Motor Vehicle Accidents: 4 YTD: 67

GREEN = Increase from prev. month
RED = Decrease “ “ !

Incidents of Note:

10/6/2025 1548 hrs. 8760 Buffalo Creek Parkway, Arson Investigation: Engins 91 and WFPD Fire
Investigator (FI 91) responded at the request of Larimer County Sheriff and Town of Wellington Parks and
Recreation to investigate property vandalized by fire. FI 91 met with LCSO who had suspects in custody and
assisted with questioning. The vandalism discovered was minor in scope but possibly linked to previous fire
damage to town property. WFPD and LCSO will be following up as the investigation continues.

10/21/2025 1012 hrs. 7590 McClellan Drive, Recreational Vehicle Fire: Engine 91 responded for a
report of a fire in a Recreational Vehicle. While enroute E91 was informed of a possible explosion. E91
arrived to find a motor home with no visible fire and light smoke showing. Investigation revealed a faulty
propane connection caused a build up of propane which was ignited accidentally. A small area of smoldering
debris was extinguished with a fire extinguisher. 1 person suffered minor injuries and refused treatment or
transport to a hospital.

10/31/2025 1200-1700 hrs. Cleveland Ave., Special Event Standby: WFPD personnel, with Town of
Wellington Staff and LCSO, provided EMS and command support for Trick or Treat on Main Street activities.
A mobile EMS first-response crew was deployed, and an officer was stationed in the Incident Command
Post for the duration of the event to respond to and assist with any emergencies and keep attendees safe.
Over 3000 children and adults converged on Cleveland Ave to enjoy the Halloween holiday. Thankfully, no
incidents were reported.




WELLINGTONG FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ACCOUNTANT'S REPORT
October 31, 2025

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
October 31, 2025 Operating and Admin Expenditures $ 41,433
October 31, 2025 Personnel Costs 277,061
TOTAL EXPENDITURES - CURRENT MONTH $ 318,494

CURRENT MONTHS REVENUES

Tax Revenue $ 29,782
Interest Income 11,919
Other Income 31,124
TOTAL RECEIPTS - CURRENT MONTH 3 72,825

CASH BALANCE PER FINANCIAL STATEMENTS

Balance per

reconciliation
COLOTRUST - Non Impact Fee accounts $ 2,993,039
Points West Bank (32,651)
Total Cash per reconciliation October 31, 2025 $ 2,960,388
Less uncleared disbursements for current month (41,433)
Add: Cash at County Treasurer 29,782
Net Cash Available $ 2,948,737

Not audited, reviewed or compiled. No assurances provided. All Disclosures are omitted.



UNAUDITED
WELLINGTON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
REVENUE & EXPENDITURE STATEMENT
ACTUAL & BUDGET FOR PERIOD ENDING ON OCTOBER 31, 2025
COMBINED FUNDS

OCTOBER YTD 2025 % OF BUDGET BUDGET
ACTUAL ACTUAL BUDGET USED REMAINING
REVENUE
4010 Larimer County Tax $ 8,038 $ 3,769,051 § 3,880,667 97.12% $ 111,616
4013 Tax Rebate Payment - (52,222) (52,222) 100.00% -
4012 Specific Ownership Tax 21,743 181,358 215,000 84.35% 33,642
4014 Wildland Firefighting - - 60,000 0.00% 60,000
4016 Service Fees - 200 1,000 20.00% 800
4017 Miscellaneous - 2,426 5,000 48.52% 2,574
4018 Donations, events, and PILOT 25,000 25,500 25,000 102.00% (500)
4020 Interest income 11,219 115,567 100,000 115.57% (15,567)
4019 Grants 500 4,863 16,200 30.02% 11,337
4015 Impact Fees 5,624 41,798 40,000 104.50% (1,798)
Lease proceeds - 1,125,426 - #DIV/0! (1,125,426)
TOTAL REVENUE 72,825 5,213,968 4,290,645 121.52% (923,323)
PERSONNEL COSTS
5010 Salaries and Wages 216,638 1,556,353 1,904,805 81.71% 348,452
5020 Wildland Salaries - 66,636 45,000 148.08% (21,636)
5025 District Board Compensation 400 4,700 9,000 52.22% 4,300
5030 Overtime 20,356 193,343 232,301 83.23% 38,958
5110 Employer Taxes 4,550 37,485 62,158 60.31% 24,673
5120 Workers Compensation 4,875 36,007 71,514 50.35% 35,507
5210 Health, Dental & Vision Insurance (3,870) 179,230 197,583 90.71% 18,353
5230 FPPA 34,113 224,203 258,666 86.68% 34,463
TOTAL PERSONNEL COSTS. 277,061 2,297,957 2,781,027 82.63% 483,070
OPERATING AND ADMIN EXPENDITURES
6010 Utilities 3,145 40,774 53,000 76.93% 12,226
6020 Station Supplies 805 8,791 6,000 146.52% (2,791)
6030 Building Repairs & Maintenance 216 20,012 25,000 80.05% 4,988
6110 Equipment and Supplies 3,825 76,710 85,000 90.25% 8,290
6120 Fuel Expenses 370 15,997 28,000 57.13% 12,003
6140 Repairs and Maintenance - Equipment 747 70,024 80,000 87.53% 9,976
6210 IT services and supplies 12,689 68,759 29,932 229.72% (38,827)
6230 Dispatch 602 9,642 14,500 66.50% 4,858
6310 Health & Safety 1,405 32,043 28,500 112.43% (3,543)
6320 Wildiand Travel Expenses - 2,136 15,000 14.24% 12,864
6330 Training & Seminars 19 19,802 63,000 31.43% 43,198
6335 Travel, Meetings and Meals - 3,383 2,650 127.67% (733)
7010 Office Expenses 1,258 5,801 6,000 96.69% 199
7020 Accounting/Finance 2,900 54,050 65,000 83.15% 10,950
7025 Legal Expenses 4,383 12,348 15,000 82.32% 2,652
7030 Professional Fees 7,400 29,932 32,000 93.54% 2,068
7050 Fees/Dues/Subscriptions 161 11,588 13,100 88.46% 1,512
7060 Payroll Processing Fees 1,117 8,662 10,000 86.62% 1,338
7070 County Treasurer Fees 161 75,380 77,613 97.12% 2,233
7080 Bank Service Charge - 188 300 62.67% 112
7100 Insurance 100 38,308 44,300 86.47% 5,992
7110 District Board Expenses - 55 5,000 1.11% 4,945
7120 Election Cost - 25,671 54,000 47.54% 28,329
6336 Contingencies - - 80,000 0.00% 80,000
6401 Public Education 131 337 1,000 33.69% 663
TOTAL OPERATING AND ADMIN EXPENDITURES 41,433 630,392 833,895 75.60% 203,503
NON OPERATING
7942 Capital Outlay 105,000 1,253,750 1,340,000 93.56% 86,250
9015 Debt Service / Lease Payments - 269,546 269,546 100.00% 0
8003 Volunteer Pension Contribution - 129,824 129,824 100.00% 0
TOTAL NON OPERATING 105,000 1,653,120 1,739,370 95.04% 86,250
TOTAL EXPENDITURES 423,494 4,581,468 5,354,292 85.57% 772,824
EXCESS (DEFICIENCY) OF REVENUE OVER
(UNDER) EXPENDITURE $ (350,669) $ 632,500 $ (1,063,647) $ 1,696,147

Not audited, reviewed or compiled. No assurances provided. All Disclosures are omitted.
1



| abed

91°080°G- 91°080's- “pesedo - €01 dwod SIIOA 10§ JusWAedal sewoy] uen|  “9GLE  G20¢2/L0/0L }sodag
sabepp pue sauefes - 0L0S
$J$09 |ouuosiad
00'000°501 00°000'50} - Aepng lended - Zv6. [elol
00°000°G01 00°000°501 00V - 0002 yonpysnig g-1 8y adid uojybug G202/91/01 g
- Aepno [ended - ZyeL
asuadxg
0Lv28°CL 0.'v28'2L o1d $S0I19
0.v28'cL 0.%28'22 awodu| [eyo |
682v0'cy 68°cv0'cl anuaAsy AraT xe| UON [ejoL
68'8L6'L1 68'8L6'LL INNIATY - 0°00¢°L fejoL
68'8L6°L1 68'8L6°L1 awoou] }salapu] - 020 IejoL
68°8L6°LL 6¥°€C6 hoie) - 00l ysodeq G20oc/LE/oL ysodaq
0v'666°0L LZ9ev'0L oo - Lok usodeq §zoe/Le/olL usodeq
€1°65S €1°65S ")j0j09 - 20) ysodeg G20zC/Le/0l ysodag
owoou| }saselu] - 0Zo¥
INNIAIY - 0°001°L
00°00S 00°00S SINVHO - 6107 [elod
00°00S 00°00S “pesado - €01 usodeq a|dieyD Aepld  t06SL  §20Z/80/0L usodag
SINVYHO - 610%
00700052 00°000's2 1071d 8 SINIAT '8 SNOILYNOQ - 810¥ [eloL
00°000'G2 00°000'62 “jesedo - €01 sexe} Jo najj urjuswAhed mod JONH SReld  GESYE  G202/20/0L ysodaq
1071d '8 SLN3A3 2 SNOLLVNOQ - 810¥
00'+29's 00°'¥29's S334 1OVdNI - LoV lejoL
00'¥29's 00'¥29's “jelado - g0l edwi ywied Buiping gzoz Jeqwieldes  ibulllspjo uMOl 09822 §20Z/ET/0L ysodeq
$33d4 10VdINI - SIoY
onuoAdy AA9T xB] UON
18'18.'62 18718262 anuansy Ane el [ejoL
eeevL'LT geevL'le dIHSY3IANMO DI14103dS - ZLov [BloL
c€eevL'le eeevL'le “Tue - 0Lov *'ge0C  S20T/IE/0L  lewnor eisusg
dIHSYINMO 214123dS - ZLoY
8b'8€0°g 81'8£0'8 sexe] Aunon JawueT - 0L0P 8101
81°'8€0'8 8y'8£0'8 -1Nds- 'Z20C G2O0Z/LE/0OL  leuinor [elausn
saxe] 3unoo Jawue - 0Lov
anuaAay Ara xe)
awoauj
asuadxgjewosu] AeulplO
aouejeg junowy nds owsap aweN wnN ajeq adAL
G20¢ 1940120 sisegd [eniaoy
[1e3oq sso % Jyoid szieULL

JOL13SIg UOo1398}0id @114 uojbulj|apn Wd Sbv



Z abed

LSev8'vl- 12'969'6- “iejes - 0L0S "°ge0T  G20T/ig/0L  leulnor [eJsus9
og'l8l'sg- 66'608'8 “leleg - 0L0S ©°¢20T  G20¢/LE/0L  [ewnor [elausg
62°€66'CL- €812 “eles - 0L0S “°C20T  G20T/ig/0L  [ewnor elsusy
28 v0C vl L8'cie'vl- ieleg - 0L0S "'¢c0c  Gc0e/ie/olL [BUINO [B18UaD)
668 96°966 ""Q0V - 0002 GC'LE0L-SZ°€00L (sajep 0 'gjoid uojbuliep t0°0L  S20Z/0E/0L g
16°,86- 9.°Gl6 jessdQ - €01 G8ZerlLL (9010AU] " UIRUNOW A¥O0Y HOV  §20¢/8Z/0L A8y
€2°€96'L- 9.'Gl6 “jesedQ - €01 TL/TSLL 1@010AU] T uigjunopy Axooy HOV  &Z20¢rez/oL ABYD
61°'6€6'2- 00'661 ‘Jessdo - €01 ** ulejunop Ao0y HOV  §20¢/02/01 perltel
6v'8el'c- cLeve'LlL ees - 0L0S "'Z20C  S202/L1/0F  [euwnor [eJsusD
29'L8E'vL- L1'62S'6- “reles - 0L0s "ge0Z  G20¢/LL/0L  feunor [elauaD
68168 66'508'8 ieleg - 0L0G 2202 G202/1L/0L  [ewnor [eJoul9
$8°L59°¢)- €5°L12 “lejeg - 010G ""¢20Z  §20¢/LL/0L  [eudnor [elsus9
1£'698'¢L- 20°L8¢e'vlL- “lefes - 0L0S ©°Z20Z  S20Z/L1L/0L  leulnor [ejsua9)
S9'LLS ce06l “jesado - €0l 6050¥1 ‘@d10AU| avidv HO®B  G20¢/LLi0L 38y
ee'lee 00°0L0C pesado - €01 9029011 :82i0AU}  ~* urejunoly ooy HOV  G20¢/vL/oL 30343
19889°L- 92965 L1 “lejeg - 010G "'¢e0¢  S20¢/e0/0L  feulnor [elsuRD)
£6'¥8Z'CL- 8G°065'6- lejeg - 0LOS 'ge0e §202/€0/01 [BlWNOf [elauag
GE'P69'e- 66°608'9 lejes - 0L0S "'g20Z  G202/€0/01L  jeulnor [elsusg)
¥£°00S'CL- €5°LLC lejeg - 0L0S 'ge0e  Sc02/e0/01 [euinof [gisusag
18°112'2L- SL'peL'bL- “hleleg - 0L0s *°g202 6202/e0/0L  jeulnop |elausgy
8¢'2eoe 25°'9v0°L “pesado - €01 Rlnsy| plepuelg HOVY  §20¢/c0/0} oLl o]
9.°G.6 9.°G.6 “jessdQ - €01 2.68801 :@210AU]  *** ureluno AYo0y HOV  §202/10/01 Asyg

Su| SuoisiA 3 [eyuaq ‘YyeeH - 0Lzs

00°6.8'v 00°6.8'v uonjesuadwo SI9IOM - 0216 [e10L
00°S.8't 00°6.8't “pesado - €01 Y6SCEIL-AN| :9210AU]  “"eInssy jodeuuld HOV  §20¢/oL/0L X3IBUD

uonesuadwon SIOIOM - 0ZLS

LL6VS'Y LL'6VS'Y soxe] Jefoldws - gL LG [ej0L
LL6VS'Y £V1685°L “eles - oLog “"¢e0Z  G20Z/Le/0L  leudnor jelsueD)
$£°266'C €LYl “eles - 0L0S ""¢¢0C  S20¢/LL/0L  [euwnor [elsuss
15085'L LG 08S°L lejeg - 0L0S “"¢202 S20C/E0/0L  lewnof [elduUlg)

soxe] sohojdwz - gLLS

00°00% 00°00¢ uopesuadwo?) pieogd 10UISIq - §Z0S 1oL
00°00¥% 00°00% “ieles - 0L0S *"¢20¢  GCO0Z/LL/0L  [eulnor [elsusD

uonesuadwo) pieog 19LsId - SZOS

£0°95£°02 €0'95€'02 SWILBAQ - Q€06 [eloL
€0'96¢'0Z $0°'G2h's “lejeg - 0L0S 'ge0C  G20cC/Le/0L  feudnor [elausD
66°0E6'vL 69'892'S “iees - 0L0S ©'220Z  G20¢/LL/0L  [eulnor [elousD
0e'Z9L'6 0€29L’'6 “Jeeg - 0L0S "'220Z  G202/c0/0L  [ewnor [elousD

SWIHBAQ - 0£0S

66°L£9'9LC 66°2€9'0LC sabepn pue sauees - 0106 [elol
66°L£9'0LC S6°705°9.L -111ds- ""¢C0C  S20Z/LE/0L  leuwlnor |elsuag
YO'eeL oVl 2e 0y vL -117ds- "'¢20¢ SC0Z/LL/0L  [ewnor JeJsusD
2LTLL's9 yZv0.°'GL -117dS- "'¢202  G202/e0/0L  [eulnor |elsusg
2571666 9E'LLE'P- “jeladQ - €0l Jousip 0} JuswAedal dwod SIBNIOM JopeQ Jebp3 ¢00L  Sc¢0c/eo/oL ysodeqg

oouejeg unouwy nds oway aweN wnnN ajeq adA)

§202 1940320
llej}oQg sso7 R Jjoid
Jo1)S1g uonavjold ail4 uojbuljjom

sisegd [eniooy
SZIELLL

Wd SL¥



¢ abey

sdo - seiddns pue Juswdinbg - 9119

8 obL ¥8ovL dinb3 - sourusjURW pue sileday - OvLY 1BJOL
¥8°9v.L 95°6 ""00V - 0002 ony Al9d,0  ""92€9  S20T/62/0L g
82°LEL 6L 00V - 000¢ olpes sj2Iyad  "UolNjos BJOIOION  "0£Z8  §202/1L2/01 g
6622 6622 DOV - 0002 omy Aiied,0  ""92€9  §20Z/90/0L ing
dinb3z - asueusjuiew pue sneday - o¥L9
soijddng pue juawdinbg
96°69L'y 96°59L'y puet @ sbuipning fejoL
00'9Le 00912 aoueuajuiel 3 siiedsy Buiping - 0809 [el0L
00'9le o0o'octL 00V - 0002 UpiQ  "'e68¢ G20¢/Sc/oL g
00°'96 00'96 OOV - 0002 Toodsay ||qeliod 59021 G20¢2/0L/0L g
aoueusjulely @ sileday Buipjing - 009
£7'508 £¥'508 saljddng uolels - 0Z09 [BJoL
£¥'608 G6°96 "0V - 0002 sieebwog §20¢/0¢e/0L g
8v'evL 60°0€Y “JI0BA - 1022 anio swies §202Z/LL/I0L  "TYD pled Hpald
6E'8LE £9'0.¢ TIPOBA - 1022 uozewny §¢02/L0/0L  "UD pled Jipaid
[SYAVA 4 [SVAVAS THP8A - 1022 an|o sweg §202/20/0L U pJe)d jipai)
sollddng uopels - 0209
£5YpLe £GPrL'E SaIHINN - 0109 [BI0L
£5PyLe 80°050°L “esado - €01 69¥02S. 16 -90I0AU| ABisuz |9oX HOV  §20¢2/62/0L 384D
Sh'v60'C 00°00L “eredo - €01 " JBUIllapA JO umo | HOV  §202/82/01 Ao3YD
SPvee’l 92'991 “jerado - €01 ABsau3 s|uH oelg HOV  §20¢/.2/01 308Ud
69°222°} 98°02 “esado - €01 "elojo] uisyuoN HOV 620¢/ez/ioL 3o8UD
£8°9G1°}L 65'6¥C jeredo - €01 G66%705100-2P90 :@2I0AU}  s8018g ljgndey HOV  §c¢0c/ic/oL 334D
¥Z'206 00'6€ "jelado - €01 "BJOJOD WISYUON HOV  S2oz/LLi0L 308Ud
¥2'898 00°6€ “jelado - €01 "eJ0j0D WsYLoN HOV  §20Z/LL/0L 398UD
¥2'6¢8 €e'L9g “Jesedo - £01 Y AsljleA sipnod HOV  G§20c2/9L/01L 38y
16°29G 16°,9G o0V - 0002 SSSIBIIM UOZUBA  "'GZL9  S202/60/01 g
SOIIIN - 0109
pue g sBupjing
96'090°L.Z 96°090°L.2 SJS0D |[sUU0SIad [e1o L
£9°ZLL'YE €9C2LLpE asuadxg Ydd4 - 0€eS leloL
€9°CLL'PE 1815801 leles - 0L0S "¢¢0¢  G2OZ/LE/0L  leuwnor [eleusD
9.'09z'ce S.'8€9 “Jees - 0L0S 'g¢0C  Ge0¢/LE/0L  leuinor [elausD
10'229'22 68°282'01L lefeg - 0L0S "'ge0e  Gcoz/iLLoL feulnor [eJsusg
ZLPeE8'LL T “leles - 010§ "'¢¢0¢  G20Z/LL/0L  [ewnor [eloudD
18°12¢'LL 188¥2'0L leleg - 0L0S "'2¢0¢  S202/e0/0L [eUINOr [eJsusD)
90°eLS 90°¢LS lejes - 0L0S '20¢  §202/e0/0L  leuinor [eisuan
osuodx] vddd - 082S
9v'0.8'¢e- 9b'0.8'¢- SU| SUOISIA ' [EJUSQ 'UlesH - 0126 jelol
9¥'0.8'¢- LL'EL6'0) lees - 0L0g ¢¢0¢  GC0C/LE/0L  leuwinor BIBUSD
aouejeg Junowy Nnds owap aweN wnN oyeq adAL

S§20¢ 4840300 siseq |en1aay
[lejag ssoT @ }ijold SZIELLL
Nd SL¥

JoL3ISIQ UORIBI0Id Bi14 uoBulllopm



{ obed

sasuadxgy ujwpy

v vyl ov'ver'l Hoddng sdo » Buiuiel] g [oAell [0l
gv'6l 9¥°61L sleulwag g Buiuel] - 0gEg e1oL
9’6l 00°Ge 00V - 0002 “UOISIAIQ opeJojo]  "6-GC  G202/8Z/01 g
¥G'GL- 89'c8 "IOBA - 1022 "IXSIN 0907 soQ G20Z/LT/0L YD pled Npalr)
2cg66- 00'sge- TUI09A - 1022 surejd sy} uo aii4 G20g/LLI0L  TID pie) Wpal)
8.'GEL 00°6¢ 02V - 0002 OIS opeJOj0)  TU6-GZ S202/vLIOL g
82°001 00°06 00V - 000 "TOISIANI] opelIojo)  "U6-G¢  G202/L0/0) g
8.°01 8201 “IIOBA - 1022 sieebuiog G202/L0/0L  "T'UD pied upaip
sieuiwasg B Buiuiel] - 0ge9
00°S0¥°L 00°S0v°L Ayoges 3 uieaH - 0LE9 lejoL
00'S0¥°L 00°sS o2V - 0002 unog sishojdws  TTO000  §202/90/01L g
00°0S€'L 00°0S€'L "0V - 0002 Buluies} sequisldeg - Jepuodsay isiid TUSL00 §202/L0/0L ng
fyajes B YIeoH - 0LL9
Hoddng sdQ g Bulujes] g |9Aes]
6€°162°El 6E£°L62'ElL "Ll 7 J39IndwoD » uoyedIuNWIWOD (8101
22’209 2c'c09 yojedsiq - 0£Z9 [eloL
2¢'c09 22'c09 OV - 0002 "y obpug [eoIBA ANl §Z02/10/0L ng
yojedsia - 0£29
L1'689'2L 2168921 alemyos Jaindwo) pue "1 - 0129 |eloL
11'689°CL 00°6L9 ™00V - 0002 -00l  L002¢ S202/LE/0L g
LLv20'C)L 66°Gl "N09A - 1022 WO0Z §202/6L/0L  "UD pied Npaid
81°850°CL £6°G61 "JOBA - 1022 2qopy §202/61L/01L YD pJed upai)
G2'298'LL 00'8cy o0V - 0002 “'ag oNand bisul  "ULOLL  SZ0Z/rL/OL g
SZTyer'LlL ooocL TISA - 1022 BnBnws §202/ci/0L YO pled Hpald
Gz yoe'tl 00°099'9 00V - 0002 wRlSAS SINANG ¥6S.P §202/20/0L g
TP’y G2'9e5'e 00V - 0002 00l  S9Lle §20¢/10/01 d
00'801°} 00°80L°1L 00V - 0002 00l  869lc G20¢/L0/0L g
alemyos Jendwion pue L7 - 0129
*1°1/ JoIndwiog 2 uopedIUNWIWOY
L9'L¥6Y 19'L¥6'Y sa||ddng pue juawdinb3 jejo |
0004 00°0.L¢ asuadx3 [end - 0zZi9 [e10).
00°0LE 00°'LgL “esedQ - €01 0££09251L¥ :@010AU|  “3josjed ABlausg HOV  §202/.2/0L o8y
00°LGE- 00°Ls¢- TUI08A - L022 WO XIA G§202/L0/0L  "IQ pled Hpai)
asuadx3 |end - 0Z19
LLpze'e 1.°v28' sdo - seyddns pue juswdinby . 9119 [eloL
YNNS4 RS [ A444 00V - 0002 0D B0INRS SN TUEZNI §20¢2/82/01 g
8z'08¢c’e EEVOP'T OOV - 0002 OO 90INBS SN TTEZNI §202/90/01 g
G6'GL6 G6'6EY “JO8A - 1022 XieH G202/20/0L  ""UQ pled Hpai)
009y 009y TI09A - 1022 SHIYS 44 Jeoue) jsealg  sisjuild jays doy G20¢/c0/01L  ""YD pled Jpald
eouejeg junoury yds owaw aweN wnnN ajeq adA)
$Z02Z 4940320 siseq jenJooy

lle}aQ ss07 %@ Jyoid
Jou3SIq uoaalold 8at4 uojbulliem

SC/ELLL
Wd Sk



G abed

uoyeanp3 ayqnd - Lov9
UONUBADIH B4

al'6Ly LY oL 6Ly LL sasuadx3 ulwpy |ejo|

00°00L 00°00L sasuadx3 souensu) - g0L/Z €101
00°004 00°00L 02V - 0002 lemsual puoq Kousby paqaul 6200 §202/0L/0L ng

sosuedx3g soueinsuj - QL2

96°091 96'091 $994 Jainseal] Ajunod - 020/ €10l
96°091 96°09L e - QLo ""¢¢0¢ Gc0Z/Le/0L  jewnor [elaueD

sead Jainseal] fjunod - 002

ov'ZLL'L o LLL'L s994 Bulssaoold Jjolhed - 090/ [€10L
o' LLL'L S HOL “jessdo - £0L Apojhed HOV  gzZoz/oe/0L 308yD
S6°2L0°'L 5008 “jesedo - €01 Apoiked  HOV  6202/02/01 %9840
06°802 Sv'v0l “jesadQ - €01 Ajooihed HOV  G20¢/gL/oL A9y
Sryol Sty0L "jesedQ - €01 Ayoolked HOV  §Z02/20/01 308U

s994 Buissedoid [joihed - 0902

86091 857001 suonduosgng pue sang - 050/ [eoL
857091 S.°0€ OBA - L1022 lol ssaid3g G202/v0/01L "4 pled ypaid
£8'6¢l G6°LL "IRBA - 1022 woo Aynqeld G202/c0/0L  ""YD pled upaid
88°1LLL 68°€6 09N - 1022 nny G202/10/01L  ""yD pled upa1p
66°LL 66°LL "08A - 1022 XilleN G2og/Lo/0L  “yQ pled upaig

suonduasqng pue sanq - 0502

00°00%°L 00°00v'L $994 |eU0ISSY0IH - 0L0/ [B10L
00°00%°L 00°00¥'Z OOV - 0002 suonoadsul Ajejes a1y "IaS [BUSIBIN a1l LPL  G202/0E/0L ng

S99 Jeuoissajold - 0S0L

05°28¢e'y 0G'Z8¢c'y sasuadxg eba - GZ0/ [e10L
05'28¢E'v 00'¥50°C 00V - 0002 $88} J18qoj00 sippes) suoAl 6 §202/Le/ol g
05°82¢'C 05°82¢€'2 OOV - 0002 G20z 0¢ Jequisideg sippes) suok 8 G2oZ/Lo/0L g

sasuadx3 |ebe - 5202

00°006'2 00°006°C soueuld % Bununosdy - 0ZoZ [e10L
00°006°¢ 000062 00V - 0002 A TTBIOOSSY B UBBID 02rPe  G20e/Le/0L g

osueuld g Buunosay - 0Z0Z

(AT A 2L°152') sasuadx3 90O - 010/ [ejoL
2L LST') 12°28¢ TUN0BA - 1022 sodojoaus pue sabplipen Jeuo) uozewy §¢€02/c2/0L  ""UD pied upald
Sy'G.l8 00°'8L JOBA - 1022 abejsod SdsSn G202/9L/0L  ""UD paed ypald
G161 98°00¢ “jetedo - €0l 61G.810% :90I10AU]  "TI4 BOUBWIEIID HOV  §20¢/sL/oL pellle)
65°96% ¥0'90% OBA - 1022 sdew joans x3jpad G202/0L/0L  "UD paed ypaid
G506 §G'06 HOBA - 1022 abpuyes ssuo) uozewy G20Z/L0/0L  "UQ pled upaiQ

sesuadx3 ao14Q - 0L0L

eouejeg Junowy uds OWwaN sweN wnN ajeq adAL
§20¢ 18403120 siseg [en1aoy
[lejoq sso7 * Jyoid sziEHL

Jo1}SIQ uonoajold aai4 uojbuljap Wd S1iv



g abed

awoau| VN

Z¥'699‘05¢- Z¥'699‘05¢-

2r'699'05¢- 2r'699'05¢- awoou) AeuipiO 19N

ZLver'eey ZLyev'eTy asuadx3 [ejoL

85°0€L 85°0¢l uolnjuanald ail] jejol

8G°0€L 85°0¢l uoleonp3 alland - 10¥9 [eloL

85°0¢) 8G°0€) THUROA - L0CC qn[o swes G202g/1e/0) YD pied ppal)
aouejeg unouwny nds ows|y aweN wnN ajeq adAL

G§20¢ 1940120
Ile}oQ SS07 2 Jyold
Jou}sIg UoR9}0.d 8114 uolBull|om

sised [enJooy
Sc/EL/LL

WNd S1:¥



Exhibit “A”
2024 Internation Fire Code, As Amended

Section 1, Adoptionof the International Fire Code, 2024 Edition, as amended

Pursuant to the Authority conferred by the District and the laws of the State of Colorado, there is
hereby adopted by the District, for the purposes of safeguarding of life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials
and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises and conditions affecting the safety of firefighters and emergency responders during
emergency operations, International Fire Code, 2024 Edition, as promulgated by the International
Code Council, being particularly the 2024 Editi on thereof and the whole thereof including
Chapters 1 through 68 in the 2024 International Fire Cede, inclusive, and appendices, save except
as any portion of the code or appendices is hereinafter deleted, modified or amended. Not less
than two (2) copies of this fire code shall be on file in the office of the Fire Marshal and may be
inspected at regular business hours and purchased from the District at a price not to exceed
ninety-seven dollars ($97.00) per copy. The provisions of this fire code shall be controlling within
the boundaries of the District.

101.1 Amend this section to read Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Wellington
Fire Protection District, hereinafter referred to as "this code”.

101.2.1 Amend this section to read Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless
specifically adopted. Appendices shall hereby be adopted as outlined in Table101.2.1;

Table 101.2.1- Appendices Adoption Status
APPENDIX TITLE STATUS
A Board of Appeals Adopted
B Fire-flow Requirements for Buildings Adopted, with amendments
C Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution Adopted, with amendments
D Fire Apparatus Access Roads Adopted, with amendments
E Hazard Categories Adopted
F Hazard Ranking Adopted
G Cryogenic Fluids—Weights and Volume Equivalents Adopted
H Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) Adopted
I Eijrsdljtr:i(:)trflesction Systems—Non-compliant Adopted




(Cont) Table 101.2.1- Appendices Adoption Status
J Building Information Sign Not Adopted
K Construc.t%o'n Requirements for Existing Ambulatory Not Adopted
Care Facilities
L SRequlrements for Fire Fighter Air Replenishment Not Adopted
ystems
M ngh—rlse Bu1ld¥ngs—Retroactlve Automatic Not Adopted
Sprinkler Requirements
N Indoor Trade Shows and Exhibitions Adopted
0 galet Traslh And Recycling Collection In Group R-2 Adopted
ccupancies

102.13 Add the following section Wildland-urban interface areas, The design and construction of new
structures located within wildland-urban interface areas shall comply with the Colorado Wildfire
Resiliency Code.

103.1 Amend this section to read Creation of agency. The Wellington Fire Protection District is hereby
created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the fire code official. The function of the agency
shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

104.8 Amend this section to read Liability. The fire code official, member of the board of appeals, officer
or employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while acting for the jurisdiction, in good faith
and without malice in the discharge of the duties required by this code or other pertinent law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered civilly or criminally liable personally, and is hereby relieved
fromall personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as aresult of an act or a mission
or by reason of an act or mission in the discharge of official duties, unless such act or a mission is willful
and wanton, as provided in the Colorado Governmental Immunity Act, Section 24-10-101, et seq., C.R.S.

104.8.1 Amend this section to read Legal defense. Any suit or criminal complaint instituted against
any officer or employee because of an actor mission performed by the officer employee in the lawful
discharge of duties an under the provisions of this code, unless such act or a mission is willful and
wanton, as provided in the Colorado Governmental Immunity Act, Section 24-10-101, et seq., C.R.S. Shall
be defended by a legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings.
The fire code official or any subordinate shall not be liable for costs inan action, suit or proceeding that
Is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this code: and any officer of the department of fire
prevention, acting in good faith and without malice, shall be free from liability for acts performed under
any of its provisions or by reason of act or omission in the performance of official duties in connection
therewith.

112.1 Amend this section to read Board of Appeals. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders,
decisions or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the application and interpretation
of this code, there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals to be known as the fire board of
appeals. The members of the Welling ton Fire Protection District Board of Directors shall appoint and
constitute the fire board of appeals as necessary. The fire code official shall be an ex officio member of




said board but shall not have a vote on any matter before the board. The board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business in shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appeal
went with a duplicate copy to the fire code official. Application for an appeal and all processes and
procedures for an appeal shall be as stipulated in 112.1.1.

112.1.1 Add the following section Procedures. To request a hearing before the board of appeals, the
applicant shall file a request in writing to the fire chief. The fire chief shall arrange for the board of appeals
to meet within ten (10) working days from the receipt of the request. All applicable fees as stated in the
fire district fee schedule shall be paid at the time the written request is made.

1134 Amend this section to read Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair
or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon
conviction shall be subject to the penalties, costs and orders provided by the local enforcement agency
and as determined by the District. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed aseparate offense.

113.5 Add_this section in its entirety Work commencing before permit issuance. In addition to
penalty set forth insection 113.4, any person or firm who, before obtaining the necessary permit(s),
commences any construction of, or work on, a building, structure, fire and life safety system(s)that is not
otherwise exempted from obtaining a permit, shall be subject to a processing and penalty fee in addition
to the standard prescribed permit fee. Such additional fine shall be equal to the permit fee, except that
such fine shall not be less than $50 or more than $1000 for the first such violation. A person or firm
committing the same violation repeatedly is subject to processing and penalty fees equal to double the
amount of the permit be or double the amount of the preceding violation, whichever is greater, for every
same such subsequent violation committed thereafter within 180-day period.

307.2.2 Amend this section in its_entirety Time and Atmospheric Restrictions. Open burning shall
only be performed when time and atmospheric conditions comply with the limits set forth in the Open
Burning Permit.

307.4.1 Amend this section in its entirety Bonfires. A bonfire shall not be conducted within 100 (30m)
of a structure or combustible material unless the fires is contained in a barbecue pit. Conditions that
could cause a fire to spread within 100 ft (30m) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition.

307.4.1.1 Amend this section in its entirety Bonfire Size. The fuel package pile fora bonfire it must be
approved prior to ignition and shall not exceed 10 feet in diameter in 8 feet in height and less approved
by the fire code official. Based on atmospheric conditions, location, adjacent structures, combustible
materials or wildland fire danger rating, smaller fuel package piles may be required period fuels for a
bonfire shall be clean, dry, untreated wood products only. Fuel shall not be added to the bonfire once it
is ignited without prior approval of the fire code official. The use of Class I flammable liquids is prohibited.
Class I combustible liquids may only be used prior to ignition and only in accordance with an approved
ignition plan.



307.4.3 Amend this section in its entirety Outdoor Fireplaces. Outdoor fireplaces shall be used in
accordance with the manufacturer's instructions. Outdoor fireplaces shall not be placed closer to
combustibles than stated in the manufacturer's instructions and if the manufacturer's instructions are not
available, or do not establish a distance, they shall not be operated within 15 feet of a structure or
combustible material. Outdoor fireplaces shall not be operated underneath the structure of any type.

308.1.7 Amend this section to read Sky lanterns. A person shall not release or cause to be released a
tethered or an untethered sky lantern.

503.1 Amend this section in its entirety Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided
and maintained in accordance with Sections 503.1 through 503.1.3 and Appendix D as amended.

503.2 Amend this section in_its entirety Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed
an arranged in accordance with Sections 503,2.1 through 503.2.8 and Appendix D as amended.

503.2.1 Amend this section in its entirety Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders, except for proved security gates in
accordance with section 503.6, and in unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet.

507.5 Amend this section in its entirety Fire hydrant systems. Fire hydrant system shall comply with
sections 507.5.1 through 507.5.6 and Appendix C as amended.

606.5 Add this section in its entirety. Solid-Fuel Fired Appliances. Solid fuel commercial cooking
appliances shall comply with applicable provisions of NFPA 96.

701.2.2 Add section to read Fire-resistance-rated labeling. The fire resistance rating of the construction
identified in Section 701.2 shall be marked in an approved manner on the following fire resistance rated
construction.

701.3.1 Add section to read Smoke barriers labeling. The fire-resistance rating and smoke-resistant
characteristics of smoke barriers shall be marked in an approved manner on the rated construction feature.

903.2 Amend this section to read Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new and
existing buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.12. Existing buildings undergoing additions, alterations or remodel work when any resulting
aggregate fire area of the building exceeds the area thresholds described in Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.12. (Exception remains)

903.2.1 Amend this section to read Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings as Group A occupancies as provided in this section.

903.2.1.1 Amend this section to read Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing Group A-1 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.




903.2.1.2 Amend this section to read Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing Group A-2 occupancies

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 ft2 (464 m2).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.

903.2.1.3 Amend this section to read Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing Group A- 3 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.

903.2.1.4 Amend this section to read Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing Group A-4 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.

903.2.1.6 Amend this section to read Assembly occupancies on roofs. Where an occupied roof has
an assembly occupancy with an occupant load exceeding 50 for Group A occupancies, an automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or
903.3.1.2.

903.2.1.7_Amend this section to read Multiple fire areas. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided where multiple fire areas of Group A-1, A-2, A-3 or A 4 occupancies share exit or exit access
components and the combined occupant load of these fire areas is 50 or more.

903.2.2 Amend this section to read Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
B occupancies as follows:
1. Throughout all Group B fire areas greater than 6,000 ft2 (557 m2) in area.
2. Where the combined fire areas of Group B on all floors, including mezzanines, is greater than
6,000 ft2 (577 m2).

903.2.2.1 Amend this section to read Ambulatory care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system shall
be installed throughout the entire building containing an ambulatory care facility where either of the
following conditions exist at any time:
1. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation.
2. One or more care recipients that are incapable of self-preservation are located at other than the
level of exit discharge serving such a facility.

903.2.3 Amend this section to read Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
E occupancies as follows:
1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 6,000 ft2 (557 m2) in area.
2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies.
3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 50 or more.

903.2.4 Amend this section to read All Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group F—1- occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:




1. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas, including any mezzanines exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557
m2).
2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.
3. A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds
2,500 ft2 (232 m2).

903.2.6 Amend this section to read Group I. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings with a Group I fire area

Exceptions:
1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be permitted
in Group I-1, Condition 1 facilities.
2. An automatic sprinkler system is not required where Group I-4 daycare facilities are at the level
of exit discharge and where every room where care is provided has not fewer than one exterior
exit door.

903.2.7 Amend this section to read Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:
1. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 6,000
ft2 (557 m2).
2. A Group M fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

903.29 Amend this section to read Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:
1. The combined area of all Group S 1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 6,000
ft2(557 m2).
2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.
3. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 5,000 ft2 (464 m2).
4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of lithium-ion or lithium metal powered vehicles
where the fire area exceeds 500 ft2 (46.4 m2).

903.2.9.1 Amend this section to read Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance with Section 406.8 of the International
Building Code, as shown.
1. Buildings with a fire area containing a repair garage exceeding 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).
2, Buildings with repair garages servicing vehicles parked in basements.
3. AGroup S-1 fire area used for the repair of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 5,000 ft2 (464 m2).
4. AGroup S-1 fire area used for the storage of lithium-ion or lithium metal powered vehicles where
the fire area exceeds 500 ft2 (46.4 m2).

903.2.9.2 Amend this section to read Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures where the area for
the storage of tires exceeds 10,000 ft3 (566 283 m3} shall be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

903.2.10 Amend this section to read Group S-2 enclosed parking garages. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout buildings classified as enclosed parking garages in accordance with
Section 406.6 of the International Building Code where either of the following conditions exists:



1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).
2. Where the enclosed parking garage is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R 3 occupancies.
3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage exceeds 6,000 ft2 (557 m2).

903.2.13 Add a new section_to read Mixed Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout all buildings containing mixed occupancies where one of the following conditions
exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 ft2 (577 mz2).
2. Where the combined fire areas of mixed occupancies on all floors including mezzanines and
basements is greater than 6,000 ft2 (577 m2).

903.2.14 Add a new section to read Buildings Constructed under the International Residential Code.
An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 shall be provided
throughout all multiple (three or more) attached single-family dwellings (townhouses), complying with
the requirements of the International Residential Code.

Exception:
Unless otherwise required by more restrictive local codes, policies, amendments, ordinances, or plat note.

903.3.1.3 Amend this section to read NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems
installed in one- and two-family dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses shall be
permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D and local codes, ordinances, and
policies.

903.3.1.4 Add section to read Core and shell buildings. Automatic fire sprinkler systems in buildings
constructed to house future tenant spaces that are not assigned an occupancy shall have minimum hazard
classification of Ordinary Hazard 2 in accordance with NFPA 13.

903.4 Amend this section to read Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. Valves controlling the
water supply for automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air
pressures and waterflow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervised by a listed fire
alarm control unit.

Exceptions:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems valves, pumps, and tanks in one- and two family dwellings.

2. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position.

3. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked in the open
position.

4. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge sprinkler systems that are sealed
or locked in the open position.

907.8.5 Amend this section to add Excessive Fire Alarms. An excessive number of false alarms shall
be defined as two (2) alarm activations for a fire alarm system within a 60-day period provided that any
such activations are not the result of a cause reasonably beyond the control of the owner, tenant or
operator of the building. In the event of an excessive number of false alarms, the fire code official may
order the building owner, tenant or operator of the building, or party responsible for the building to take
reasonable actions necessary to prevent false alarms. These actions may include repair or replacement of



the faulty alarm components, addition of tamper proof devices, modification of system design, and repair
of other building components which affect alarm system performance. The fire code official may also
require the building owner, tenant or operator or party responsible for the building to obtain an
approved maintenance contract with a qualified fire alarm maintenance technician asrequired by NFPA
72 to provide continuous maintenance service of the system.

1103.5.3 Amend this section to read. Group I-2, Condition 2. In addition to the requirements of Section
1103.5.2, existing buildings of Group I-2, Condition 2 occupancy shall be equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. The automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed as established by the adopting ordinance. System to be installed as directed by
the fire code official.

5704.2.9.6.1 Amend this section to read. Locations where above ground tanks are prohibited.
Storage of Class | and II liquids in above ground tanks I said buildings is prohibited in accordance
with local land use code.

5704.3.3 Amend this section to read. Indoor storage. Storage of flammable and combustible liquid
inside buildings in containers or portable tank shall be in accordance with sections 5704.4.4.1 through
5704.3.3.10 unless otherwise required by more restrictive local codes, policies, amendments, ordinances,
or plat.




Appendix Bis deleted in its entiretv and readopted to read as follows

APPENDIX B
FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

SECTION B101 GENERAL

B101.1 Scope. The procedure for determining fire-flow requirements for buildings or portions of
buildings hereafter constructed shall be in accordance with this appendix. This appendix does not apply
to structures other than buildings.

SECTION B102 DEFINITIONS
B102.1 Definitions. For the purpose of this appendix, certain terms are defined as follows.

FIRE-FLOW. The flow rate of a water supply, measured at 20 pounds per square inch (psi) (138 kPa)
residual pressure, that is available for firefighting.

FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA The floor area, in square feet (m?), used to determine the required fire
flow.

SECTION B103 MODIFICATIONS

B103.1 Decreases. The fire chiefis authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for isolated buildings
or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the development of full fire-flow
requirements is impractical.

B103.2 Increases. The fire chief is authorized to increase the fire-flow requirements where conditions
indicate an unusual susceptibility to group fires or conflagrations. An increase shall not be more than
twice that required for the building under consideration.

B103.3 Areas without water supply systems. For information regarding water supplies for fire- fighting
purposes in rural and suburban areas in which adequate and reliable water supply systems do not exist,
the fire code official is authorized to utilize NFPA 1142 or the International Wildland- Urban Interface
Code.

SECTION B104 FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA

B104.1 General. The fire-flow calculation area shall be the total floor area of all floor levels within the
exterior walls, and under the horizontal projections of the roof of a building, except as modified in Section
B104.3.

B104.2 Area separation. Portions of buildings which are separated by fire walls without openings,



constructed in accordance with the International Building Code, are allowed to be considered as separate
fire-flow calculation areas.

B104.3 Type 1A and Type 1B construction. The fire-flow calculation area of buildings constructed of
Type 1A and Type 1B construction shall be the area of the three largest successive floors.

Exception:
Fire-flow calculation area for open parking garages shall be determined by the area of the largest floor.

SECTION B105 FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

B105.1 One- and two-family dwellings. The minimum fire-flow requirements for one- and two- family
dwellings shall be 1,000 gallons per minute in urban areas and 500 gallons per minute in rural areas.

Exception:
Areductionin required fire flow of 50 percent, as approved, is allowed when the building is provided with
an approved automatic sprinkler system.

B105.2 Buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings. The minimum fire-flow and flow duration
for buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings shall be as specified in Table B105.

Table B105
MAXIMUM DISTANCE
e ow | JEACNG - ROM HE CLOSEST
APPLICATION REQUIREI;/IENTS HYDRANTS BUILDING TO A
(gpm (feet)™b« HYDRANT
(feet)*
Commercial/ d
Multifamily 1,500 600 300
One- & Two-
Family Dwelling - 1,000 800 400
Urban
One- & Two-
Family Dwelling - 500 800 400
Rural




a) Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

b) Where streets are provided with median dividers that cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling
hose lines, or are arterial streets, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on each side of the street
and be arranged on an alternating basis.

¢} Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection
of structures or similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed
1,000 feet to provide for transportation hazards.

d) For buildings equipped with a standpipe, see Section 507.5.1.1.

B105. Water supply for buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system. For buildings
equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system, the water supply shall be capable of providing
the greater of:

1. The automatic sprinkler system demand, including hose stream allowance.
2. The required fire-flow.



Appendix Cis deleted in its entirety and readopted to read as follows:

APPENDIX C
FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION

SECTION €101 GENERAL

€101.1 Scope. Fire hydrants shall be provided in accordance with this appendix for the protection of
buildings, or portions of buildings, hereafter constructed or moved into the jurisdiction.

SECTION C102 LOCATION

C102.1 Fire hydrant locations. Fire hydrants shall be provided along required fire apparatus access
roads and adjacent public streets.

SECTION C103 NUMBER OF FIRE HYDRANTS

C€103.1 Fire hydrants available. The number of fire hydrants available to a complex or subdivision shall
not be less than that determined by spacing requirements listed in Table B105 when applied to fire
apparatus access roads and perimeter public streets from which fire operations could be conducted.

SECTION C104 CONSIDERATION OF EXISTING FIRE HYDRANTS

C104.1 Existing fire hydrants. Existing fire hydrants on public streets are allowed to be considered as
available. Existing fire hydrants on adjacent properties shall not be considered available unless fire
apparatus access roads extend between properties and easements are established to prevent obstruction
of such roads.

SECTION C105 DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

€105.1 Hydrant spacing. The average spacing between fire hydrants shall not exceed that listed in Table
B105. Regardless of the average spacing, fire hydrants shall be located such that all points on streets and
access roads adjacent to a building are within the distances listed in Table B105.

Exception:
The fire chief is authorized to accept a deficiency of up to 10 percent where existing fire hydrants provide
all or a portion of the required fire hydrant service.



Appendix D is deleted in its entirety and readopted to read as follows

APPENDIX D
FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

SECTION D101 GENERAL

D10L.1 Scope. Fire apparatus access roads shall be in accordance with this appendix and all other
applicable requirements of the International Fire Code.

SECTION D102 REQUIRED ACCESS

D102.1 Access and loading. Facilities, buildings or portions of buildings hereafter constructed shall be
accessible to fire department apparatus by way of an approved fire apparatus access road with an asphalt,
concrete or other approved driving surface capable of supporting the imposed load of fire apparatus
weighing at least 80,000 pounds (36,287 kg).

D102.2 Access road construction. All access roadways must be all weather driving surfaces capable of
supporting fire apparatus. Surface shall be asphalt, concrete, or compacted road base and engineered for
the imposed loads.

D102.2.1 Temporary emergency access. Compacted road base or chip shall only be used for a
temporary emergency access Temporary access shall be available as long as the site is under construction.
Thereafter permanent fire lanes shall be accessible and unobstructed at all times.

D102.2.2 Permanent emergency access. All permanent points of access shall be hard decks consisting
of asphalt or concrete designed to HS 20 or support 40 tons (36,287 kg). Compacted road base or other
surfaces engineered and capable of supporting the imposed loads may be approved for ground mounted
solarinstallations, cell towers and similar isolated facilities and structures when approved by the fire code
official.

D102.2.2 Installation timing. All required access roads must be installed and serviceable before
aboveground construction begins.

SECTION D103 MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS

D103.1 Access road width with a hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire apparatus access
road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7,925 mm) exclusive of shoulders.

D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads shall not exceed 10 percent in grade. Exception: Grades
steeper than 10 percent as approved by the fire code official. (See section D105.5 for aerial fire apparatus
access roads.)

D103.3 Turning radius. The minimum turning radius shall be 25 feet inside radius and 50 feet outside
radius.



D103.4 Angle of Approach/Departure. Grade changes upon a Fire Apparatus Access Road or when
entering or exiting from or to a Fire Apparatus Access Road shall not exceed a 10 percent Angle of
Approach or Angle of Departure.

100' HAMMERHEAD
EMERGENCY ACCESS EASEMENT

HSE  FPHIVATE PHOPERTY DNLY)

ol LA & =5 U

TYRHGALL

e

- - FIRE '~’><> LANE

PUBLIC R.OMW.

EXAMPLE BUILDING

ot anigh Bt

Figure D103.1



100' DIAMETER
CUL-DE-SAC
FOR USE ON PUBLIC OR PRIVATE PROPERTY

MUST CONNECT TO ——
PUBLIC RO W. w

20

Of §R101% 20 f

Figure D103.1 {cont.)

ALTERNATIVE HAMMERHEAD

EMERGENCY ACCESS EASEMENT
(FIRE LANE)
USE: PRIVATE PROPERTY ONLY

L S0 (TYPICAL)

pie

|

1

|
- -

\

e

28R- [WPICAL)ﬁ —

20

EXAMPLE BUILDING

2 /" MUST CONNECT TO

— 25'R - (TYPICAL}
Ve PUBLIC ROW
e
\< |

0Ofi 6f10f. 20 ft

Figure D103.1 (cont.)



D103.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (46 m) shall be provided
with width and turnaround provisions in accordance with Table D103.4.

TABLE 103.4

REQUIREMENTS FOR DEAD-END FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

| LENGTH | wmotH
TH WIDTH
(feet) (feet) TURNAROUNDS REQUIRED
0-150 20 None required
100-foot hammerhead, 100-foot cul-de-sac
- 151_660*7 b »20v - in accordance with Figure D103.1
Over 660 N Special Approval Required

D103.5.1 Second Point of Access Required. A second point of access shall be required when the primary
access roadway exceeds 660 feet (201 m) in length.

Exception: Where all dwelling units beyond 660 feet (201 m) are equipped throughout with an approved
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1,903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.3, access from two
directions shall not be required.

D103.5.2 Third Point of Access Required. A third point of access will be required when any access road
exceeds a distance of 1320 feet (1/4 mite) (402 m) in length.

Exception:

Where all dwelling units beyond 660 feet (201 m) are equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1,903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.3, access from only two
directions shall be required.

D103.5.3 Fourth Point of Access Required. A fourth point of access will be required when access road
exceeds a distance of 2640 feet (1/2 mile) (804 m) in length.

Exception:

Where all dwelling units beyond 660 feet (201 m) are equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.3, access from only three
directions shall be required.

D103.5.4 Access location. Where two or more points of access are required, they shall be placed a
distance apart equal to not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of
the property or area to be served, measured in a straight line.

D103.6 Fire apparatus access road gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus access roads shall comply
with all of the following criteria:



1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6,096 mm). Where
a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate shall be not less than 12 feet (3,658
mm).

2. Gates shall be of the swinging or sliding type.

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced or
repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department personnel
for emergency access. Emergency opening devices must be approved by the fire code official.

6. Methods of locking the gate must be approved by the fire code official.

7. Manual opening gates shall not be locked with a padlock or chain and padlock unless the padlock
is approved by the fire code official and is compatible with the approved Key Boxes in use by the
fire department.

8. Gate design and locking device specifications shall be submitted for approval by the fire code
official prior to installation.

9. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL325.

10. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to comply
with the requirements of ASTM F 2200.

D103.7 Signs. Where required by the fire code official, fire apparatus access roads shall be marked with
permanent NO PARKING-FIRE LANE signs complying with Figure D 103.6 or other approved sign. Signs
shall have a minimum dimension of 12 inches (305 mm) wide by 18 inches (457 mm) high and have red
letters on a white reflective background. Signs shall be posted on one or both sides of the fire apparatus
road as required by section D103.6.1 or D103.6.2.

SIGN TYPE "C"

N\

SIGN TYPE "A" SIGN TYPE "D"

e r y - ]

NO NO NO

PARKING
FIRE LANE

12"

PARKING
FIRE LANE

~— 12"

FIGURE D103.7
FIRE LANE SIGNS

PARKING
FIRE LANE

— 12—



D103.7.1 Roads 20 to 26 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in D103.6 shall be posted on both
sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 26 feet wide (6,096 to 7,925 mm).

D103.7.2 Roads more than 26 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in D103.6 shall be posted on
one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 26 feet wide (7,925 mm) and less than 32 feet wide
(9,754 mm).

D103.7.2 Minimum Overhead Clearance. Fire access roads shall have a minimum overhead clearance
for the entire width of the access road of not less than 14 feet (4,267 mm).

SECTION D104 COMMERCIAL AND INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENTS

D104.1 Buildings exceeding three stories or 30 feet in height. Buildings or facilities exceeding 30 feet
(9,144 mm) or three stories in height shall have at least two means of fire apparatus access for each
structure.

Exception:

Buildings or facilities exceeding 30 feet (9,144 mm) or three stories in height may have a single approved
fire apparatus access road when the buildings are equipped with approved automatic sprinkler systems.

D104.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 ft2 in area. Buildings or facilities having a gross building area of
more than 62,000 ft2 (5,760 m*) shall be provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus access
roads.

Exception:

Projects having a gross building area of up to 124,000 ft? (11520m2) that have a single approved fire
apparatus access road when all buildings are equipped throughout with approved automatic sprinkler
systems.

D104.3 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they shall be placed a distance apart equal to
not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the lot or area to be
served, measured in a straight line between accesses.

SECTION D105 AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

D105.1 Where required. Where the vertical distance between the grade plane and the highest roof
surface exceeds 30 feet (9,144 mm), approved aerial fire apparatus access roads shall be provided. For
purposes of this section, the highest roof surface shall be determined by measurement to the eave of a
pitched roof, the intersection of the roof to the exterior wall, or the top of parapet walls, whichever is
greater.

D105.2 Width. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum unobstructed width of 26 feet (7,925
mm}, exclusive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of any building or portion of building more than 30
feet (9,144 mm) in height if the fire access road is not a dead end. Dead end fire apparatus access roads
for aerial apparatus access shall be a minimum of 30 feet (9,144 mm) wide.



D105.3 Proximity to building. At least one of the required access routes meeting this condition shall be
located within a minimum of 15 feet (4,572 mm) and a maximum of 30 feet (9,144 mm) from the building
and shall be positioned parallel to one entire side of the building. The side of the building on which the
aerial fire apparatus access road is positioned shall be approved by the fire code official.

D105.4 Obstructions. Overhead utility and power lines shall not be located over the aerial fire apparatus
access road or between the aerial fire apparatus road and the building. Other obstructions shall be
permitted to be placed with the approval of the fire code official.

D105.5 Grade. Aerial fire apparatus access roads adjacent to the building shall not exceed five percentin
grade.

SECTION D106 MULTIPLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

D106.1 Projects having more than 100 dwelling units. Muitiple-family residential projects having
more than 100 dwelling units shall be equipped throughout with two separate and approved fire
apparatus access roads.

Exception:

Projects having up to 200 dwelling units may have a single approved fire apparatus access road when all
buildings, including nonresidential occupancies, are equipped throughout with approved automatic
sprinkler systems installed in accordance with Section 903.3 1.1.

D106.2 Projects having more than 200 dwelling units. Multiple-family residential projects having
more than 200 dwelling units shall be provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus access
roads regardless of whether they are equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

SECTION D107 ONE- OR TWO-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

D107.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments. Developments of one- or two-family
dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceeds 30 shall be provided with two separate and
approved fire apparatus access roads and that comply with Section D103.4.4.

Exceptions:

Where there are more than 30 dwelling units on a single public or private fire apparatus access road and
all dwelling units are equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler System in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.3, access from two directions shall not be required.

D107.2 Future Connections. The number of dwelling units on a single fire apparatus access road shall
not exceed 30 dwelling units unless fire apparatus access roads will connect with future development, as
determined by the fire code official.



Wellington Fire Protection District
PO Box 10 /8130 3rd St. Wellington CO 80549

IFC FIRE CODE RESOLUTION FOR 2025 REGULAR DISTRICT BOARD MEETING

WELLINGTON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
RESOLUTION NO. 2025-009

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE 2024 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONL FIRE CODE,
REGULATING AND GOVERNING CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE AND PROPERTY
FROMFIRE OR EXPLOSION, AND PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS FOR

HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATIONS

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors of the Wellington Fire Protection District
(WFPD) have previously adopted the 2018 International Fire Code.

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors deems it necessary to adopt the following code
for the purpose of establishing rules of conduct and standards for the protection of life,
health, property, security and welfare of the inhabitants of the District; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors has considered the effect of fire code
enforcement within the boundaries of the District and has determined that enforcement of
the proposal codes would not cause undue hardship or suppression of economic growth
within the district; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Directors has studied the necessity for realistic and
reasonable level of fire protection to be provided by a fire protection district

NOW, THEREFORE, be it resolved by the Board of Directors of the Wellington
Fire Protection District in the County of Larimer, State of Colorado that:

1. The WFPD Board of Directors adopts the 2024 International Fire Code

ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 19th day of November, 2025

WELLINGTON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

By

Board President
ATTEST:

By

Board Secretary



COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT
between
WELLINGTON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
and
INTERNATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF FIREFIGHTERS
WELLINGTON FIREFIGHTERS
LOCAL 5389

January 1, 2026 through December 31, 2026

TENTATIVE AGREEMENT



INDEX

PREAMBLE
GENERAL

ARTICLE | - RECOGNITION

1.1 Freedom of Association
1.2 Representative and Negotiation Guidelines

ARTICLE li - TERMS

21 Term and Renewal
2.2 Budget Increase Limitations
2.3 Union Negotiators

ARTICLE Il - WORK SCHEDULES

31 Work Hours

3.2 Holidays for Daytime Firefighters

33 Holidays for Shift Firefighters

34 Holiday Definitions

35 Emergency Recall

36 Authorized Holdover

3.7 Authorized Call Back (For Minimum Staffing)
38 Use of Compensatory Time

39 Trading Time

ARTICLE IV — COMPENSATION
4.1 Salaries

4.2 Longevity Pay
43 Acting Positions



ARTICLE V - VACATION

51 Vacation
5.2 Use of Vacation

ARTICLE VI - SICK LEAVE/ PTO

6.1 Sick Leave/ PTO
6.2 Light Duty Requirement

ARTICLE VIl -~ MILITARY LEAVE
7.1 Military Leave with Pay
ARTICLE VIl — PERSONAL DAYS
8.1 Personal Days

ARTICLE IX — CLOTHING

9.1 Uniform Allowance
ARTICLE X — INSURANCE

10.1 Health Care Benefit
10.2  Life Insurance

ARTICLE Xi — RETIREMENT

11.1  Pension Fund

11.2  Death and Disability Contribution
11.3  Post Employment Health Plan (PEHP)
ARTICLE XIl — RULES AND REGULATIONS
12.1 Applicability of Rules and Regulations

ARTICLE XIll - MANAGEMENT OF DISTRICT

13.1 Reservation of Management Rights
13.2  Exclusive Management Rights

ARTICLE XIV — STRIKES AND LOCKOUTS



14.1  No Lockout
14.2  No Strike

ARTICLE XV — UNION BUSINESS

15.1  Dues Check Off
15.2  Indemnification
15.3  Union Leave

ARTICLE XVI - GENERAL MATTERS

16.1  Amendments

16.2  Governing Law

16.3  Severability

16.4  Schooling or Special Education
16.5 Separated Firefighters

16.6  Terminated Firefighters

16.7  Beneficiary of Estate

16.8 Bereavement Leave

16.9 Emergency Leave

16.10 Staffing

16.11 Promotions

16.12 District Growth and Trigger Clause

ARTICLE XVII - SPECIALIZED DIVISIONS

17.1  Technician Pay

ARTICLE XVIIl - GRIEVANCE PROCEDURES

18.1  Definition

18.2  Purpose

18.3  Rights of Firefighter to Representation

18.4  Form of Formal Grievance

18.5 Procedure

ARTICLE XIX — ARBITRATION PROCEDURES FOLLOWING GRIEVANCES

19.1 Procedures

Article XX Legal Proceedings



20.1 Waiver of Breach
20.2  No Third Party Beneficiaries

ARTICLE XXI PERSONNEL REDUCTIONS

21.1 Personnel Reductions

DEFINITIONS

BOARD. The term “Board” shall mean the Board of Directors of the District.

DISTRICT. The term “District” shall mean the Wellington Fire Protection District. It shall include authorized
officers, representatives, and agents.

FIRE CHIEF. The term “Fire Chief” shall mean the fire chief of the District.

FIREFIGHTER. The term “Firefighter” shall mean an employee of the District whose primary duties are
directly involved with the provision of firefighting and/or emergency medical services. “Firefighter” does
not include non-sworn or clerical personnel or volunteer firefighters. Further, “Firefighter” does not
include any supervisor who holds the rank of a chief officer. (Firefighter in4.1.2 is in reference to rank).

UNION. The term “Union” shall mean the International Association of Firefighters Local 5389. It shall
include all authorized officers, representatives, and agents.

PROFESSIONAL FIREFIGHTER. Any firefighter who is a fulltime paid firefighter



PREAMBLE

Itis the public policy of the District to promote and maintain harmonious relations between the
Board and the full-time Firefighters employed by the District to protect the public health, safety,
and welfare by assuring at all times the orderly and uninterrupted operations and services of the
District. This policy is implemented by recognizing and defining the rights of full-time Firefighters
in this Agreement to join organizations of their own choosing for the purpose of representation
in matters affecting employee relations or to represent themselves individually in said matters in
dealings with the Board. Additionally, the Board and Union desire an opportunity through this
Agreement to provide for equitable and peaceful adjustment of differences which may arise, and
to establish standards of wages, hours, and certain other conditions of employment

GENERAL

This Agreement is entered into by and between the WELLINGTON Fire Protection District (here
in after referred to as the “Board” or “District”) and Local 5389 of the international Association
of Fire Fighters (hereinafter referred to as the “Union”).

Itis the purpose of this Agreement to supersede and replace any and all prior agreements
between the Board and the Union, in order to achieve and maintain harmonious relations
between the Board and the Union, to provide for equitable and peaceful adjustment of
differences which may arise and to establish proper standards of wages, hours and other
conditions of employment.



1.1

1.2

ARTICLE |
RECOGNITION

The Board recognizes the Union as the exclusive representative of all full-time Firefighter
employees of the District, except the fire chief and those officers above the rank of captain.

FREEDOM OF ASSOCIATION

Notwithstanding the aforementioned provision, each and every employee of the District shall
have the right to join, or refrain from joining, any lawful organization for their benefit or
economic improvement and for the advancement of the purposes of the Board.

REPRESENTATIVE AND NEGOTIATION GUIDELINES

Any labor or employee organization acting on behalf of a designated bargaining unit may file a
petition with the Board for recognition as the exclusive bargaining agent. The petition must
contain the signatures of more than 50% of the employees within the bargaining unit and allege
either that said employees desire to be represented for the purpose of collective bargaining, or
that the labor or employee organization presently certified as the exclusive bargaining agent is
no longer the choice of the majority of the employees of the bargaining unit as their exclusive
bargaining agent.

Where a petition has been filed pursuant to the above provision, the Board shall either agree to
acknowledge the Union without further proceedings or shall conduct a secret ballot of all
eligible employees (those within the bargaining unit) to determine if and by whom the
employees wish to be represented. An affirmative vote of at least a majority of all employees
eligible to vote shall be conclusive.



2.1

2.2

2.3

ARTICLE Il
TERMS

TERM AND RENEWAL

This Agreement shall be effective as of January 1, 2025 2026, and shall remain in full force and
effect through December 31, 2625 2026. This agreement shall remain in effect until a successor
agreement is agreed upon by both parties. The board of directors and the executive board of
the Union shall meet for the purpose of negotiating salaries, health benefits, pension benefits,
and twe six additional items; each party to select ene three such item for negotiating a
successor agreement.

All financial commitments that extend beyond the one year shall be subject to annual
appropriation by the Board for the next budget year.

Negotiations shall commence on or after July, 1 2025, and any unresolved issues shall be
submitted to mediation. The mediator shall be chosen in accordance with the selection
provisions of Section 19.1 of this contract. The request for a panel of mediators from the
Federal Mediation and Conciliation Service shall be formed. If the mediation process has not
resulted in an agreement as to the negotiated issues, the parties shall move to advisory
arbitration with an arbitrator who is chosen in accordance with the selection provision
contained in Section 19.1 of this contract. The arbitrator shall select between the final offer of
each party submitted to the opposing party on each unresolved issue. The arbitrator shall
notify the parties of his/her decision, which shall be advisory upon all parties involved. It is
specifically understood and agreed that the parties shall continue to negotiate and may reach
agreement on any and all unresolved issues through the mediation and arbitration process.

BUDGET INCREASE LIMITATIONS

Both parties recognize that the ability of the District to increase expenditures is subject to
limitations imposed by the Division of Local Government, Article 10, Section 20 of the Colorado
Constitution and the voters of the District, also known as the Taxpayer Bill of Rights

(TABOR). This Agreement shall be reopened prior to the necessity of laying off any District
personnel when it is shown to the firefighter representatives, during and only during the
budgeting process, that revenue sources are not sufficient to fund its obligations.

UNION NEGOTIATORS

In the event of negotiations or renegotiations of the provisions of the Agreement, reasonable
numbers of negotiators selected by the Union (not to exceed three, and one alternate) shall be



3.1

3.2

3.3

released from their regular duties, without loss of pay, for all meetings when such
representatives would normally be on duty.

ARTICLE Il
WORK SCHEDULES
WORK HOURS
3.1.1 Those Firefighters assigned to line duty shall work a 24-hour, three platoon system. For

3.1.2

313

314

315

the purpose of this Agreement only, such Firefighters shall be designated as line duty
Firefighters and/or shift Firefighters. Those hours will be assigned by the fire chief and
approved by the Union for a total of 56 hours a week. Subject to the provisions of
Section 4.1, which defines the hourly rate for hours worked in excess of the FLSA period;
i.e., in excess of 216 hours per 27-day period or in excess of 192 hours per 24-day
period, overtime will be paid at time and one-half of the hourly rate.

Those Firefighters assigned to other than line duty, shall work those hours as assigned
by the fire chief for a total of 40 hours minimum per week. For purposes of this
Agreement only, such Firefighters shall be designated as daytime Firefighters.

Overtime shall be paid at time and one-half of the hourly rates for daytime Firefighters.

Because daytime uniformed Firefighters are paid the same yearly and monthly salaries
as shift workers under Section 4.1, daytime Firefighters who work shift duties, pursuant
to Section 3, shall be paid overtime shift worker hourly rates.

Firefighters that have worked, or are scheduled to work, 72 consecutive hours will not accept an
overtime, detail assignment or trade shift without at least 24 consecutive hours in an off-duty
status except for Emergency recall to duty, Hold-overs to complete the duty shift, Mandatory
training hours, or Approval of the Fire Chief

HOLIDAYS FOR DAYTIME FIREFIGHTERS

The following days shall be holidays for daytime Firefighters: New Year's Day, Martin Luther
King Day, Presidents’ Day, Memorial Day, Independence Day, Labor Day, Veterans Day,
Thanksgiving, the day after Thanksgiving and Christmas. Any daytime Firefighters working on
these days will receive monetary pay at the rate of 1% times their hourly base rate.

HOLIDAYS FOR SHIFT FIREFIGHTERS

The following days shall be holidays for shift Firefighters: New Year’s Day, Martin Luther King
Day, Presidents’ Day, Memorial Day, Independence Day, Labor Day, Veterans Day, Thanksgiving,



3.4

3.5

3.6

3.7

3.8

the day after Thanksgiving and Christmas. All District shift personnel shall receive 8 hours
straight pay at their base pay rate.

HOLIDAY DEFINITIONS
The definition of a holiday is the day that it is observed.
EMERGENCY RECALL

Off duty Firefighters shall be subject to emergency recall at the discretion of the fire chief. All
emergency recalled Firefighters shall be compensated for emergency recall in accordance with
Section 3.8 below. Payment for recall hours shall begin at the time the Firefighter is required to
report for duty. A 2 hour minimum will be paid to all recalled Firefighters at 1 % hour rate.

AUTHORIZED HOLDOVER

Holdover time shall be compensated in the same manner as recall with any major fraction of
one-quarter hour being credited as one-quarter hour. As with recall, compensation shall be in
accordance with Section 3.8 below.

AUTHORIZED CALL BACK (FOR MINIMUM STAFFING)

All Firefighters called back for duty shall be compensated in accordance with Section 3.8

below. Time shall be computed from the time the Firefighter reports to the assigned station for
duty and checks in with the station officer or district chief if the station officer is not in
guarters.

USE OF COMPENSATORY TIME

3.8.1 Notwithstanding the foregoing requirement that Firefighters be compensated at 1%
times the individual hourly rate for overtime work. Compensatory time off may be
provided to Firefighters in lieu of monetary compensation for time required of a
Firefighter beyond the regular shift for staff and other special meetings (by example, but
not by way of limitation); i.e., for safety council meetings, for educational programs and
conferences, and for other matters where an Firefighter’s time is required by the
District.

3.8.2 Reimbursement through compensatory time shall be at the rate of 1% hours of
compensatory time for each hour of overtime worked. The maximum compensatory
time which may be accrued by any Firefighters shall be 72 hours. A Firefighter who has
accrued the maximum number of compensatory hours shall be compensated in cash for
any additional overtime hours of work.

3.8.3 Upon separation, if an Firefighter has accumulated time, he/she shall be entitled to be
paid for the remaining compensatory time at his/her regular hourly rate.



3.8.4 24 hours of compensatory time per shift will be available for members’ use per District

3.9

policies and procedures.

TRADING TIME

Voluntary trading of time between Firefighters will be allowed so long as the Firefighter
involved in the trading of time complies with administrative procedures and directives
of the fire chief or his/her designee. Trading of time will be done within the limits of the
Firefighter’s acting capacity, with approval of the district chief. In no event shall the
District incur any expense for trading time.



ARTICLE IV
COMPENSATION

4.1 SALARIES
4.1.1 The District base salaries paid to shift Firefighters, excluding longevity or special teams
pay shall be regarded as payment for one hundred six (106) hours per 14-day work
period. Hours in excess of 106 shall be paid at 1% times the hourly rate. For the
purposes of determining the hourly rate per Firefighter, the Firefighter’s salary shall be
divided by 2,912 for Uniform Line Personnel and 2080 for Uniform Day. Holiday
compensation as provided by Sections 3.2, 3.3 and 3.4, shall not be deemed to be
included in base salary and shall be deemed extra pay.
4.1.2 The salary schedule for 2026 shall be:
Grade | Year Rank Hourly Rate Annually
1 0-1 | Probation $22.23 $64,729
2 2 Firefighter $23.56 $68,613
3 3 Firefighter/ DO | $24.90 $72,496
4 4 Firefighter/ DO | $26.24 $76,409
Top 5 Senior FF $27.57 $80,293
Grade | Year Rank Hourly Rate Annually
DOE Lateral
1 0-1 | Probation $29.99 $87,325
2 2 Captain-Lieut $31.45 $91,575




4.2

4.3

3 3 Captain Lieut $32.90 $95,795
4 4 Lieut/Capt. $34.36 $100,045
Top 5 Lieut/ Captain $35.81 $104,264
LONGEVITY PAY

At the first pay period in December following five (5) years of full-time service to the District,

Firefighters shall become entitled to an annual longevity bonus, to be paid in accordance with

the following schedule:

0 through 4 years of service

S0

5 through 9 years of service

equal to 1% of grade 1 Firefighter annual salary

10 through 14 years of service

equal to 2% of grade 1 Firefighter annual salary

15 through 19 years of service

equal to 3% of grade 1 Firefighter annual salary

20 through 24 years of service

equal to 4% of grade 1 Firefighter annual salary

25 years of service and beyond

equal to 5% of grade 1 Firefighter annual salary

ACTING POSITIONS

Acting pay will be added to the base pay of any Firefighter who is temporarily assigned to work

in an acting position higher than his/her present rank as determined by the District’s Board-
adopted organization chart and staffing reports. The rate of payment shall be 100% of the

difference between the hourly rate of payment for the position in which he or she is acting and

the hourly rate of the Firefighter’s current rank. Such acting Firefighter shall be paid for each
hour, or portion thereof, as the Firefighter actually works in the acting position.




All Firefighters filling that position will be compensated retroactive to the first
hour. Management reserves the right to utilize “rovers” to be assigned on a temporary basis to
any vacant position caused by iliness, leave, vacation or any other reason.

ARTICLE V
VACATION

5.1 VACATION

5.1.1 Any shift Firefighter that transfers to day shift assignment shall be required to
utilize accrued vacation according to the day shift accrued schedule. The following
conversion factors will be used when a Firefighter transfers to day shift assignment or
back to duty on the line. If the Firefighter's employment relationship is terminated
while working the day shift, the accrued vacation which has been converted pursuant to
this section and which has not been utilized shall be paid at 100% the Firefighter’s shift

rate.

5.1.2
Vacation | 0-2Years | 3-5Years |6-10 Years 11-15 Years | 15+ Years
Vacation Line Staff | 96 hrs, 120 hrs. 168 hrs. 216 hrs. 240 hrs.
Cap (hrs.) 144 180 252 324 360
Carryover (hrs.) 120 150 210 270 300
Vacation Daytime | 80 hrs. 100 hrs. 140 hrs. 180 hrs. 200 hrs.
Firefighter
Cap (hrs.) 120 150 210 270 300
Carryover (hrs.) 100 125 175 225 250




5.2

Use of Vacation

5.2.1 Vacation time will be used in the year following the year of service giving rise to its
accrual, including any change in vacation accrual rate. All vacations shall be
picked solely on the basis of seniority based on the date of hire with the
District. Vacation days may be used for time off with the district chief's approval, or
his/her designee.

5.2.2 Vacation time accumulated to the effective date of this Agreement will continue to be
recognized. When an Firefighter is off work due to an on-the-job injury or illness,
he/she shall not be charged with any vacation leave, and if it cannot be used
within that year it shall be carried over to the following year, and/or be paid.

5.2.3 A period during which an Firefighter is on leave of absence or suspension shall not be
counted in the calculation of years of service for determination of vacation leave.

5.2.4 No Firefighter shall use un-accrued time without prior approval from the Fire Chief.



6.1

6.2

ARTICLE VI
SICK LEAVE/ PTO

SICK LEAVE/ PTO

6.1.1 All Firefighters shall be granted 96 hours of sick leave/PTO per calendar year. Although
granted for the year, it is earned proportionally to the time employed in the
district. Sick leave usage will be charged on an hour-for-hour basis.

6.1.1.1 Effective January 1, 2026, 2027 and 2028, an additional 16 hours of sick leave/PTO will
be added to the total amount of PTO granted. (2026-112 hrs. total, 2027-128 hrs. total,
2028-144 hrs. total)

6.1.2 Firefighter’s Sick Leave/ PTO bank has a max of 400 hrs.

6.1.3 The District shall pay directly into an Firefighter’s PEHP or 457 retirement plan 400 hours
of sick leave from such Firefighter’s sick leave bank at the Firefighter’s then current
hourly rate, provided that: (1) the Firefighter has up to 400 hours in the Firefighter’s sick
leave account; (2) the Firefighter has served at least 20 years with the District; and, (3)
the separation from employment with the District is not due to a dismissal for cause or a
resignation in lieu of such dismissal for cause. The Firefighter will be paid out at 25% up
to 400 hrs into either the PEHP or 457 retirement plan.

The District shall pay directly into a Firefighter’s PEHP plan or 457 retirement, up to 400
hours (max hours) at a rate of 10% , provided that: (1) the Firefighter has served at least
five years with the District; and, (2) is at least 55 years of age,; and (3) the separation
from employment with the District is not due to a dismissal for cause or resignation in
lieu of such dismissal for cause.

LIGHT DUTY REQUIREMENT



6.2.1

6.2.2

6.2.3

6.2.4

6.2.5

6.2.6

6.2.7

If any Firefighter is excused from duty on paid sick leave or injury leave for a period
exceeding 30 calendar days, such Firefighter shall, at the written request of the District,
submit to a physical examination by the District’s physician and one non-partisan
physician, all at the District’s expense. If the Firefighter wants to submit a report from
his/her attending physician he/she may do so at his/her expense.

If it is determined, as a result of said examination, that the Firefighter would be capable
of returning to work on light duty without risk to his/her health or aggravation of
his/her condition, the Firefighter shall return to work and be assigned to light duty until
the earlier of: (1) the date upon which the Firefighter is able to return to his/her regular
duty; or, (2) one year from commencement of the Firefighter’s initial absence on sick or
injury leave.

Prior to the end of the one-year period, the Firefighter must make an application to the
Pension Board for a normal or early retirement or disability pension or request
reinstatement to active regular duty.

While on any type of sick or injury leave, the Firefighter will continue to receive his/her
full pay, for 12 months from the first day of such injury or sick leave.

When a Firefighter returns to work on light duty, as described above, it shall be with full
pay and benefits.

After ten weeks (400 hours) on light duty from an off-duty injury, the Firefighter will
forfeit 16 hours of sick leave from their sick leave bank for every week of light duty work
thereafter. The week of returning to full duty, normal retirement, or disability, will be
prorated on a 40-hour work week.

Scheduling and assignment of light duty Firefighters shall be at the sole discretion of the
Fire Chief.

6.2.8 There shall be a light duty policy that outlines the provisions of light duty assignments.



7.1

ARTICLE VII
MILITARY LEAVE

MILITARY LEAVE WITH PAY

Any Firefighter covered by this Agreement who is called to active military service as a member
of the Armed Forces of the United States, or who is engaged in activities in the reserve forces of
the National Guard shall be granted a leave of absence to perform such military duties. Said
Firefighter shall not suffer any loss of leave time or other benefits because of said military duty.
Such leave shall be considered "Military Leave". Said military leave shall not exceed fifteen (15)
days per year. For the purposes of this section, a “day” is one (1) twelve (12) hour shift.



8.1

ARTICLE VIII
Personal Days

Personal Days

Personal day shall be twe one day (24 hour shift) off. To accrue these- this day the Firefighter
shall attend +we one mandatory department staff meeting. These this day shall only be used per
District policies and procedures. Fhese this day shall not roll over or accumulate for future
years. Fhey It shall only be used within the calendar year.



ARTICLE IX
CLOTHING

9.1 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE

9.1.1 The District shall provide initial clothing per the uniform regulations and
protective clothing as required by law. Thereafter the District will provide uniforms on a
wear and replace basis in accordance with procedures to be established by the

District. The Chief will set forth in policy all items of uniform required by uniformed
Firefighter. All used uniforms to be replaced will be returned to the District in exchange
for new. The District maintains its right to inspect uniforms and to require upkeep and
replacement as deemed necessary.

9.1.2 The fire chief may authorize the replacement of a Firefighter’s uniform damaged in the
line of duty.

9.1.3 All Uniformed Personnel shall have a Class A Uniform provided to them at the district's
expense at their 1 year anniversary.



10.1

10.2

ARTICLE X
INSURANCE

HEALTH CARE BENEFIT

10.1.1

10.1.2

10.1.3

The District recognizes the strategic planning team that will comprise up to three (3)
District employees appointed by the fire chief, and three (3) Union representatives
appointed by the union president. One (1) appointed position for the District and one
(1) appointed position for the Union will co-chair the strategic planning team. The
strategic planning team will review annually all health, vision and dental insurance and
present recommendations to the district for consideration. The District agrees to pay
100% of the total premium cost of the provided health care plan for the member and
50% of the premium cost of the member’s spouse and dependents. The Firefighters
agree to pay 50% of the total cost of the provided health care plan for spouses and
dependents.

Any amounts paid by the District for health benefits under this section shall not be
regarded as part of a Firefighter’'s wages for purposes of calculating hourly base rate.

Any applicable new federal legislation, which becomes effective during the term of this
contract, may require renegotiation of this section.

LIFE INSURANCE

10.2.1

The District shall pay the cost of term life insurance for each individual. Coverage shall
be the same as the individual’s annual base pay plus longevity as set forth in this
agreement capped at $100,000. Payments made by the District for life insurance in
accordance with this policy shall not be regarded as part of an individual’s wages for
purposes of computing retirement benefits and income.



11.1

11.2

11.3

ARTICLE XI
RETIREMENT

PENSION FUND

Pension benefits for any uniformed firefighter will be governed by C.R.S. §31-3-1702 and the
District’s New Hires Pension Fund. Funding for New Hires will continue as outlined in C.R.S.
§31-31-402.

DEATH AND DISABILITY CONTRIBUTION

11.2.1 During the term of this Agreement, the District shall pay, on behalf of all firefighters
hired after January 1, 1997, the state mandated contribution for death and disability
coverage pursuant to C.R.S. §31-31-811(4).

POST EMPLOYMENT HEALTH PLAN (PEHP)

11.3.1 The District will contribute $10 per month to each Firefighter’s (PEHP) plan in 2025.



12.1

ARTICLE XNl
RULES AND REGULATIONS

APPLICABILITY OF RULES AND REGULATIONS

The rules, regulations and operational guidelines of the District, as the same are amended from
time-to-time, shall be binding upon the parties to this Agreement. Rules, regulations and
operational guidelines shall not be inconsistent with terms of this Agreement. Any alleged
violations of the provisions of this Agreement shall be subject to and governed by the grievance
procedure contained in this Agreement. All Firefighters shall be fully informed of the rules,
regulations and operational guidelines, hereafter enacted and directives thereafter issued. No
changes in the grievance procedure shall be valid unless agreed to in writing by the Board and
the Union. Nothing in this Agreement shall be interpreted as restricting the powers and
authority of the board of directors under state law to amend the rules and regulations of the
District. Amendments to the District’s rules, regulations and operational guidelines may be
made in consultation with the Union, but may be made without Union endorsement or
ratification.



ARTICLE XilI
MANAGEMENT OF DISTRICT

13.1 RESERVATION OF MANAGEMENT RIGHTS

13.1.1 MANAGEMENT RIGHTS RESERVED. The District reserves and retains solely and exclusively
all of its constitutional, statutory, and common law rights and responsibilities to manage
the District and to take all necessary actions to carry out the mission of the District. The
management of the District and the direction of the employees are vested solely and
exclusively in the District, and shall not in any way be abridged, except as specifically
limited by the express terms of this Agreement.

13.2 EXCLUSIVE MANAGEMENT RIGHTS
The exclusive rights of the District include, but are not limited to, the following:

13.2.1To determine the mission of the District and the methods, processes, and means by which
said mission is said to be fulfilled, and to decide any matters of a policy nature;

13.2.2 To determine District policy, including the right to manage the affairs of the District in all
respects, including, but not limited to, determining and implementing the methods,
equipment, facilities, and personnel policies, procedures, directives, practices, and other
means by which District operations are to be conducted, and taking the steps it deems
necessary to maintain the efficiency and safety of operations of the personnel engaged
therein;

13.2.3 To develop enforce, modify, or terminate any policy, procedure, manual, work method,
or the like, associated with the operations of the District



13.2.4To determine training needs, methods of training, and Firefighters to be trained;

13.2.5 To extend, limit, or curtail the operation of the District, including to determine or
consolidate the location of operations, offices, and work sites, including permanently or
temporarily moving operations, in whole or in part, to other locations;

13.2.6 To direct the work of all employees, and determine the duties of a position;

13.2.7 To hire, promote, demote, classify, evaluate, and retain employees in positions with the
District;

13.2.8 To determine the size, composition, and makeup and distribution of the workforce,
including staffing levels;

13.2.9To demote, suspend, discharge or otherwise discipline employees for cause;

13.2.10 To transfer, assign, and schedule employees, including determining schedules, creating
schedules, and establishing or modifying the workweek, including mandatory overtime
work.

13.2.11 To determine whether to lay off employees due to, lack of work, lack of funds, or for
other legitimate reasons;

13.2.12 To determine its budget, organization, and the merits, necessity, and level of any activity
or service provided by the District, and other fiscal policies; and,

13.2.13 To determine whether to merge with any other fire district or municipality;

13.3 AUTHORITY OF FIRE CHIEF.

Nothing in the Agreement shall be construed to limit the authority of the Fire Chief to
exercise powers of discipline. However, in exercising Management Rights, nothing shall
be construed or applied which negates, modifies, or supersedes the rights of Firefighters
or the Union where such rights are specifically included in this Agreement.



14.1

14.2

ARTICLE XIV
STRIKES AND LOCKOUTS

NO LOCKOUT

The District agrees that so long as this Agreement is in effect there shall be no lockouts. The
closing down or curtailing of any specific operation or any part thereof shall not be construed as
a lockout.

NO STRIKES

The delivery of fire protection services to the citizens of the District in the most efficient,
effective, and courteous manner is of paramount importance to the District and the Union.
Acceptance of public employment carries with it an obligation and responsibility to act
affirmatively at all times to ensure the continuation and promotion of the public’s health, safety,
and welfare. Such achievement is recognized to be a mutual obligation of both parties within
their respective roles and responsibilities. During the term of this Agreement, the Union will not
cause, or permit its members to cause, nor will any member of the representative unit take part
in any strike, sit down, slow down, stay in, walkout, curtailment of operations, or any picketing.
All Firefighters and the Union are prohibited from engaging in this conduct. Any violation of the
foregoing provision shall be grounds for immediate discharge.



15.1

15.2

15.3

ARTICLE XV
UNION BUSINESS

DUES CHECK OFF

The District agrees to deduct each pay period, dues and assessments in an amount certified to
be current by the secretary/treasurer of the Union from the pay of all Firefighters who are
covered by this Agreement and who have agreed to these deductions. The total amount of
deductions shall be remitted each month by the District to the secretary/treasurer of the
Union. This authorization shall remain in full force and effect during the term of this
Agreement.

INDEMNIFICATION

The Union agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the District for any loss or damage arising
from the operation of this Article, unless such loss or damage is caused or contributed by the
action of the District; provided that the District shall forward copies of any written claim or any
documents filed to initiate or proceed upon any civil action questioning the propriety of any
provision in this Article to the Union and provided further, the District shall permit and allow
the Union and its attorney(s) to fully control and fully participate in the defense of any such
action.

UNION LEAVE

15.3.1 Officers of the Union and their representatives shall be entitled to leave with pay for
official union business and conventions provided 96 hours of notice is provided to the
Chief. The leave will be limited to a total of 9- twenty four hour shifts per year.

15.3.2 The above listed Union Leave is in addition to leave which is granted for union officers
acting in official capacities in grievance hearings, arbitration hearings, and negotiation



16.1

16.2

16.3

16.4

sessions. It is understood that the number of union officers or members representing
the union eligible to receive leave with pay during negotiations shall not exceed two.

ARTICLE XVI
GENERAL MATTERS

AMENDMENTS

No change, recession, alteration, modification, or amendment of this Agreement, in whole or in
part, shall be valid unless the same is ratified in writing by both the District and the Union.

GOVERNING LAW

This agreement shall be governed and constructed according to the constitution and laws of the
state of Colorado.

SEVERABILITY

If any provision of this Agreement is illegal or invalid for any reason, such illegality or invalidity
shall not affect the remaining provisions. On the contrary, such remaining provisions shall be

fully severable and this Agreement shall be construed and enforced as if such illegal or invalid

provision never had been inserted in this Agreement.

SCHOOLING OR SPECIAL EDUCATION

16.4.1 The District shall continue to pay all tuition, books, fees and expenses incurred for
schooling or special education, which is a job requirement, except for prerequisite
education.

16.4.2 The District shall pay tuition, books, fees, and pre-approved related expenses for post-
secondary, accredited education, which is work-related, but not job required. All
education must be pre-approved by the District and meet the intent of applicable



16.5

16.6

16.7

Administrative Procedures. Any amount paid by the District for education, in
accordance with this section shall not be regarded as part of an Firefighter’s wages for
purposes of calculating hourly base rate. Additionally, the District shall reimburse a
member up to 75% of the tuition and book expenses, up to a total of $4,000 per year for
education which is work related but not job required. Education funding from the
District will have a lifetime cap of $24,000. All education must be pre-approved by the
District for reimbursement. Reimbursement is contingent on a passing grade or
certificate of completion.

16.4.3 The District retains the discretion to pay or not to pay for work-related but not job
required education.

SEPARATED FIREFIGHTER

16.5.1 Vacation time accrued and unused from the previous year will be paid at the prior salary
rate.

16.5.2 Prior to a separated Firefighter’s final pay, an audit will be performed of owed vacation
time and that monetary amount shall be reduced from muster out pay to be paid in full
to the owed Firefighter at the current hourly rate of the separated Firefighter.

16.5.3 Muster out pay will be paid one pay period following the last paycheck for regularly
worked hours,

TERMINATED FIREFIGHTER

Terminated Firefighters shall be compensated for all accrued and unused vacation time at their
current hourly rate.

BENEFICIARY OF ESTATE

16.7.1 In case of the death of a firefighter (on or off duty), the firefighter’s beneficiary will be
compensated for all the accrued and unused vacation time accumulated at the salary
rate at the time of death.

16.7.2 In the event a firefighter is killed in the line of duty or dies from injuries sustained in the
line of duty, the District shall pay the cost of funeral expenses up to a maximum of
$20,000, which amount shall be offset by any other payments for funeral expenses



16.8

16.9

16.10

16.11

made by insurance or by any other agency or organization or person(s) (other than
relatives of the firefighter). This payment shall be made to the firefighter’s estate.

BEREAVEMENT LEAVE

Shift workers will be granted two full shifts (48 hours) of bereavement leave with pay, and day
workers will be granted 50 hours of bereavement leave with pay, which leave will not be
deducted from vacation time or accumulated sick leave, in the event of a death in the
immediate family of the Firefighters or the Firefighter’s spouse. Immediate family is defined to
include spouse, member’s and or spouse’s children, father, mother, brother, sister, grandchild,
grandparents or great grandparents, and other members of the family at the fire chief’s
discretion or his/her designee. An extension of leave may be granted at the Chiefs discretion.

EMERGENCY LEAVE

Emergency leave may be granted by the district chief or designee to a member for an
emergency to a member’s immediate family member defined to include spouse, member’s and
or spouse’s children, father, mother, brother, sister, grandchild, grandparents or great
grandparents. The firefighter must use PTO, Vacation, or Compensatory time. Emergency leave
applies to emergencies requiring immediate medical attention. The leave may be granted for
up to an entire shift or for the remainder of the shift (and for the work day or remainder of the
work day for day worker) on which the emergency is incurred. Any such emergency leave
granted shall not be carried over to another shift or to another workday. If further time is
required the member shall be responsible for using their compensatory time or obtaining the
proper trade time.

STAFFING

The District and the Union recognize the goal of the District is to meet the intent of NFPA 1710
for reasons of safety and a high level of service. Accordingly, it s mutually agreed that all
engine companies shall have the minimum staffing of 3 full time professional firefighters. In the
event that staffing is reduced to one engine, staffing shall consist of three full-time Wellington
Professional Firefighters.

In the event that budget and other factors, such as changes in technology, dictate a different
level of staffing, the District and the Union will confer prior to changing the staffing levels
stated in this Article to find an amicable solution.

PROMOTIONS

The parties will follow the policies as outlined in District Policy #100-XX.



16.12 DISTRICT GROWTH AND TRIGGER CLAUSE
16.12.1 District Growth

It is the intent of this section to recognize that as the District continues to expand, both in
service demands and financial capacity, that the Parties should maintain proactive and
positive communication regarding matters impacted by such growth. Growth shall include,
but is not limited to, increased staffing, new stations or apparatus, changes in service
delivery models, or substantial budget increases. The parties agree to meet and confer
over the impacts of District growth. In doing so, the Union may provide its input to the
District regarding such impacts and Union’s interests related to them. The District shall
receive and consider this input as the District makes, in its sole discretion, its operational
and management decisions. No mutual agreement is required on any growth issue with
the intent of this provision being the ability of the parties to have open and transparent
dialogue on these matters.

16.12.2 Trigger Clause

It is the intent of this section to provide a mechanism that activates the meet and confer

meeting requirement as set forth in Article 16.12.1 when specific, pre-defined conditions
are met. The following will be considered triggers to meet and confer meeting process on
growth impacts:

1. Call Volume: An increase of 25% or greater in annual call volume over a rolling two-
year average.

2. New Facilities: The opening of a new fire station or substation within the District.

3. Apparatus Expansion: The addition of a staffed engine, ladder, rescue or ambulance
into service.

Upon the occurrence of a trigger event, the District and the Local shall meet and confer in
a timely manner to discuss the potential impacts of the growth trigger on the District and
personnel. The goal of this provision is to ensure timely and collaborative adjustments
between the parties, in particular input from the Union to the District, in response to
material changes that may impact the District and the members of the Local.



17.1

ARTICLE XViI
SPECIALIZED DIVISIONS

TECHNICIAN PAY

For serving in any of the following special divisions within the District, a member shall be paid
technician pay for each of the following divisions. Except for paramedics and uniformed
daytime Firefighters, technician pay shall not be considered in the calculation of the base hourly
rate or any other benefit of each member receiving the same.

17.1.1 All certified paramedics shall receive a $1000.00 stipend annually.

17.1.2 The district shall not be responsible for the recertification of Paramedic licensure and
shall not bear any expense in obtaining a Paramedic certification.



18.1

18.2 PURPOSE

ARTICLE XVIIi
GRIEVANCE PROCEDURES

DEFINITIONS
18.1.1 Grievance: A grievance shall mean a complaint by a Firefighter, Firefighters, the Union, or

the District that there has been a violation, a misinterpretation, or inequitable
application of any of the provisions of the Agreement between the District and the
Union. The term grievance shall not apply to: (1) any discipline or charges against a
member for violation of rules and regulations of the District; (2) any matter as to which
the Board is without authority to act; (3) any matter where the method of review is
prescribed by law. An aggrieved person is a Firefighter(s) asserting a grievance. The
Union may assert a grievance, which, in its judgment, affects a group of Firefighters.

18.1.2 Grievant: The term “grievant” shall mean a Firefighter who has filed a written Grievance

bearing the Firefighter’s signature. Where a Grievance affects a group of Firefighters
and the Union has asserted the Grievance on behalf of all affected Firefighters, the
Grievant shall be the Union and not the individual Firefighters.

Nothing herein contained will be construed as limiting the right of any Firefighter having
a grievance to discuss the matter informally with any appropriate member of the
supervisory staff and having the grievance adjusted, provided the adjustment is
consistent with the terms of the Agreement and provided the Firefighter follows the
chain of command. Good morale is maintained, as issues or challenges arise, by sincere
efforts of all persons concerned, to work toward constructive solutions in an
atmosphere of courtesy and cooperation. The purpose of this procedure is to secure, at
the lowest possible administrative level, equitable solutions to the problems which may,
from time to time, arise. The Union shall have the opportunity to be present and to
state its views at any level in the grievance procedure beyond Step 1.



18.3 RIGHTS OF FIREFIGHTERS TO REPRESENTATION
18.3.1 No Discrimination. There shall be no discrimination against any Firefighter, Union
representative, or other participant in the Grievance process based upon participation
in the Grievance process.
18.3.2 Representation by Union. A Grievant may be represented by the Union at any stage of
the Grievance process and additionally may seek the assistance of the Union in the
preparation and presentation of the Grievance.

18.4 Form of Formal Grievance
Any formal Grievance must be in writing and contain the required information as set
forth below. Neither the District nor the Union is required to act upon Grievance that
does not contain all of the required information as set forth below:

18.4.1 The date the dispute or event(s) giving rise to the grievance;

18.4.2 A statement of any efforts to resolve the dispute through the chain of command;

18.4.3 The name of the Grievant(s);

18.4.4 A description of the dispute or event(s) giving rise to the Grievance, including, but not
limited to a description of how, when, and where it arose; the parties involved; and its
present status;

18.4.5 All documentary evidence in support of the Grievance;

18.4.6 A statement with a description of the specific provision(s) of this Agreement that has
been allegedly violated, misinterpreted, or inequitably applied;

18.4.7 A proposal for how the Grievant believes the dispute should be resolved;

18.4.8 The date of the Grievance, and;

18.4.9 The signature of the Union President or designee and the signature of the Grievant. If
the Grievance is on behalf of a class of Firefighters, the signature of the Union President
or designee and only one member of the class will be required.

18.5 PROCEDURE

No grievance shall be recognized unless it shall have been presented at the appropriate
level within fourteen {14) calendar days after the aggrieved person knew, or should
have known, the act or condition on which the grievance was based. The time limits
specified in these procedures may be extended by mutual agreement of the involved
parties. In any event, the Firefighter shall perform his/her assigned task and aggrieve
his/her complaint later.

18.5.1 Step 1. Request for Grievance with the Union: The aggrieved Firefighter shall notify a
Union representative as to the particulars of the complaint (informal). An earnest
effort should be made to resolve said differences by a meeting between the
Firefighter(s), the Union, and the Chief or his/her designee. If the matter is not resolved
at Step 1 the Firefighter or his/her representative may proceed to Step 2. However,
failure to proceed to Step 2 shall constitute affirmation by the Firefighter to the fact that
the matter was settled at Step 1.



18.5.2 Step 2. Request for Grievance with the Union: If such grievance is not resolved within
two (7) calendar days thereafter, the Firefighter(s) shall present his/her grievance to
the Executive Board of the Union in writing within two (2) calendar days. The
Executive Board of the Union shall then discuss the grievance in accordance with the
Constitution and Bylaws of the Union and handle all grievances so presented to them
within five (5) calendar days, and report their action to the subsequent meeting of the
Union.

18.5.3 Step 3. Filing Formal Grievance with Fire Chief: In the event the Executive Board
decides that the grievance is justified it shall notify the Chief of its decision in writing
with a request to meet for the purpose of resolving said grievance within two (2)
calendar days. The Chief shall sign and date the formal Grievance to acknowledge its
receipt. Said meeting shall take place within seven (7) calendar days of receipt by the
Chief of the written request of the Executive Board and an earnest effort will be made
to resolve said grievance. The Union and District may mutually agree in writing to
extend the seven (7) day time limit. The Chief shall, thereafter, render his decision in
writing within five (5) days of said meeting. If the matter is not resolved at Step 3, the
Firefighter or his/her representative may proceed to Step 4. However, failure to proceed
to Step 4 shall constitute affirmation by the Firefighter to the fact that the matter was
settled at Step 3.

18.5.4 Step 4. Appeal to the Board of Directors. In the event the Union does not accept the
decision of the Chief, then it shall request, in writing, to the Board of Directors for a
hearing not less than twenty (20), nor more than thirty (30) calendar days following
receipt of said written notice. The board of directors shall schedule a hearing and give
notice of the date, time and place thereof to the Firefighter, the Union and the Fire Chief.
Such hearings shall be conducted in accordance with the District’s rules and regulations
and each party shall be given the opportunity to present the facts and their respective
positions concerning the grievance. The board of directors shall render, within the ten
(10) days following this hearing, a final decision on the issue. If the matter is not
resolved at Step 4, the Firefighter or his/her representative may proceed to Step 5.
However, failure to proceed within seven (7) days after the completion of Step 4 shall
constitute affirmation by the Firefighter to the fact that the matter was settled at Step 4.

18.5.5 Time Limits. With the sole exception of the provisions of 18.7.6, a decision on the
grievance shall be rendered within the time limit set forth or the grievance shall be
deemed favorable to the grievant. Failure at any step of this procedure to appeal a
grievance to the next step within the time limits shall be deemed to be acceptance of
the decision rendered at that step. The time limits specified in these procedures may be
extended by mutual agreement of the involved parties prior to the expiration of the
time limits.



18.5.6 Request for Arbitration. Should the decision of the Board of Directors be unsatisfactory
to the Union, then it shall submit the grievance to arbitration in accordance with the
Colorado Uniform Arbitration Act.

18.5.7 Selection of an Arbitrator In the event the parties are unable to agree upon an arbitrator
within ten (10) working days from the date the Union demanded arbitration, they shall
request a panel of seven (7) from the Federal Mediation and Conciliation service and
select from the panel one person to serve as arbitrator by alternatively striking names
from the list until one remains. The remaining name shall be the name of the arbitrator.

18.5.8 Arbitration Meetings. The arbitrator will have authority to hold hearings and make
procedural rules therefore. All arbitration meetings shall be in closed sessions and no
news releases shall be made concerning subjects of the arbitration. The arbitrator will
issue a report within a reasonable time after the date of the hearing or, if all hearings
have been waived, then from the date of the final statements and evidence are
submitted to him/her. The arbitration shall be held and completed within ninety (90)
days from the selection of the arbitrator. The arbitrator’s report shall be given within
thirty (30) days after the final hearing date, unless otherwise mutually agreed to by the
parties to this Agreement. The arbitrator’s report shall be submitted in writing and shall
set forth his/her findings of fact, reasoning and conclusions on the issues submitted.
The arbitrator’s decision shall be final and binding on the parties. No arbitrator shall
have the authority to alter or amend, add to or delete from the Agreement or any of its
provisions. The cost for the service of the arbitrator, including per diem expenses, plus
actual and necessary travel and subsisted expenses, if any, shall be borne by both
parties equally. It is understood that time frames relative to arbitration are subject to
the schedule of the Arbitrator and both parties agree to accommodate as necessary.

18.5.9 Miscellaneous Grievance Provisions

18.5.9.1 Firefighter Coverage. Firefighters shall suffer no loss of pay for reasonable time
necessarily lost from their regularly scheduled working hours while investigating
and processing grievances as provided for in the grievance procedures. It is
expressly understood that in no event shall a Firefighter representative leave his
work for grievance purposes without first notifying and obtaining approval of
his/her immediate supervisor. When it is necessary for a Firefighter to attend a
grievance meeting or hearing during a regularly scheduled shift, the Fire Chief
shall notify the Union and the Firefighter and the Firefighter shall be released
from duty without loss of pay for such time as their attendance is required at
such meeting or hearing.

18.5.9.2 Sharing of Information. The District agrees to make available to the aggrieved
person and his/her representative, all pertinent information in its possession or
control and which is relevant to the issues raised by the grievance.



19.1

18.5.9.3 Non-Grievable Matters. Matters not covered by this Agreement shall not be
subject to the grievance provisions of the Agreement.

ARTICLE XIX
ARBITRATION PROCEDURES FOLLOWING GRIEVANCES

PROCEDURES

In the event the parties are unable to agree upon an arbitrator within ten (10) working days
from the date the Union demanded arbitration, they shall request a panel of seven (7) from the
Federal Mediation and Conciliation service and select from the panel one person to serve as
arbitrator by alternatively striking names from the list until one remains. The remaining name
shall be the name of the arbitrator. The arbitrator will have authority to hold hearings and
make procedural rules therefore. He/she will issue a report within a reasonable time after the
date of the hearing or, if all hearings have been waived, then from the date of the final
statements and evidence are submitted to him/her. The arbitration shall be held and
completed within ninety (90) days from the selection of the arbitrator. The arbitrator’s report
shall be given within thirty (30) days after the final hearing date, unless otherwise mutually
agreed to by the parties to this Agreement. The arbitrator’s report shall be submitted in writing
and shall set forth his/her findings of fact, reasoning and conclusions on the issues

submitted. The arbitrator’s decision shall be final and binding on the parties.

The cost for the service of the arbitrator, including per diem expenses, plus actual and
necessary travel and subsisted expenses, if any, shall be borne by both parties equally.



ARTICLE XX
LEGAL PROCEEDING

20.1 LEGAL PROCEEDING

The Union expressly herein agrees that it will not institute or participate in, except as a co-
defendant or a co-plaintiff with the District, any claim, lawsuit or other legal proceeding,
challenging the language of this Agreement as being violated or void under law.

The Union further expressly herein agrees that in the event that any claim, lawsuit or legal
proceeding is filed or commenced by any member or members of the Bargaining Unit, acting on
their own personal behalf and not on behalf of the Union, challenging the language of this
Article as being violative or void under law, the Union shall join with the District in defending, as
a party defendant, the provisions and language of this Article. The District and the Union will
pay their own defense costs in such a litigation.

20.2 WAIVER OF BREACH

The waiver by any party to this Agreement of a breach of any term or provision of this
Agreement shall not operate or be construed as a waiver of any subsequent breach by any
party.

20.3 NO THIRD PARTY BENEFICIARIES

None of the terms, conditions, or covenants set forth in this Agreement shall give or allow any
claim, benefit, or right of action by any third person not a party to this Agreement. Any person



other than the parties to this Agreement who or which receive services or benefits under this
Agreement shall be only an incidental beneficiary.

ARTICLE XXI
PERSONNEL REDUCTION

21.1 PERSONNEL REDUCTION

21.1.1 The District shall notify the Union of the need to reduce the number of Firefighters who are on
payroll within the bargaining unit at least 90 days before the effective date of a layoff. Such
notice shall be given in writing addressed to the Union by certified mail. The notice shall disclose
the number of positions affected, the rank or classification of each position so affected, and the
unit or units, if any, which are to be disbanded. Immediately after issuing the notice, the
Employer shall give the Union a reasonable period of time, of no less than 30 days, within which
it shall meet and confer with the Union to discuss such action. The Employer shall respond to
any proposals which the Union may make in response to the subject matter of notice.

21.1.2 Each Firefighter who is to be reduced in rank or laid off as a consequence of a reduction in force
or the disbandment of any unit shall be given written notice, at least 30 days before such action
is to occur; of the date, the purpose and nature of the action that is to be taken with regard to
him or her. The notice shall state the reasons for the action, and any rights which the Firefighter
may have with regard to his or her employment. A copy of the notice also shall be timely
delivered to the Union.

21.1.3 All reductions in force shall be established by seniority in the Department. Departmental seniority
shall be established from the date that the Firefighter was hired into the Fire Department as a



full-time Firefighter. Seniority in rank or classification shall be established from the date that the
Firefighter was promoted into the rank or classification which he or she currently occupies.

21.1.4 In the event of a tie in seniority, the tie shall be broken on the score they received during the
testing process.

21.1.5 There shall be no preference granted for subjective evaluation of performance, skill or ability
when determining who to reduce from rank to rank, or who to lay off.

21.1.6 For purposes of determining either seniority in rank or departmental seniority, the following

additional rules also shall apply for layoffs and reductions in rank within the Fire Department.
First, should an Firefighter who formerly was employed by the Fire Department return to the
service of the Department after a break in service due to an injury or illness causing disability, all
time which intervened shall be counted in the Firefighter’s favor as if the Firefighter lost no time
away from work. Second, should a Firefighter return to the Department after having resigned
from service or voluntarily transferred from Fire Department service, his or her seniority shall
begin anew.

21.1.7 In the event a reduction in force is necessary, the reduction shall proceed in the following order:
Firefighters shall be laid off in reverse order of departmental seniority; the most junior
Firefighters within the Department shall be laid off first, without regard to rank or classification.

21.1.8 In the event that a reduction in force results in the need for a redistribution of Firefighters from
superior ranks to lesser ranks, such reductions in ranks shall be accomplished by reducing in
rank those Firefighters with the least tenure in the affected rank counting from the Firefighter’s
date of promotion.

21.1.9 An Firefighter who is laid off shall be paid for all accrued but unused leave time.

21.1.10 All Firefighters who are reduced in rank or laid off shall not suffer any loss in benefit or
entitlement accrued prior to the date of the action, e.g., holidays, vacation, personal leave,
pension, and overtime, earned, accumulated and unused at the time of reduction in rank or
layoff.

21.1.11 If possible, each junior Firefighter who is bumped out of rank or classification shall, in turn, be
reduced only one rank, to the rank or the classification immediately junior. This shall not pertain
to layoffs, which shall be consistent with Departmental seniority rights.

21.1.12 Any Firefighter who is reduced in rank and involuntarily transferred into a new unit shall be
entitled to acting compensation. Any Firefighter who at first received acting certification in rank
and then was promoted, upon return to that rank or classification after demotion, shall retain
his or her original acting certification and approval date, and shall enjoy the right to exercise the
same.

21.1.13 If the current salary is the same as or greater than the maximum of the lower grade, the
Firefighter shall receive the maximum salary for the lower grade. If the current salary is less than
the maximum of the lower grade, the Firefighter shall receive the closest salary rate of the lower
grade.



21.1.14 The district shall prepare and maintain a list, known as a “Reemployment List”, of all persons
who are reduced in rank or laid off, by rank or classification. In the event that vacancies occur
within the Department while persons remain on the Reemployment List, the order of recall shall
be determined by reference to the Reemployment List. The Reemployment List(s) shall remain
in effect for 36 months after the date of a layoff (unless extended by the Department of
Personnel) and shall be used to offer employment opportunities that may become available by
seniority to all persons who have been reduced or laid off, before any Firefighters are promoted
from one rank to another or any persons are hired or transferred. No person may be hired,
while any person in that rank or classification remains in a reduced rank or on the
Reemployment List. Any persons who were bumped more than one rank would be first eligible
for return to the next higher rank before such position is filled by Firefighters demoted only one
rank. Firefighters shall be placed in the pay grade of their former rank, restored to the level of
total annual compensation that they would currently receive had they not been reduced in rank
or placed on the Reemployment List. The Firefighter shall receive no credit for longevity while
on layoff.

21.1.15 Notice of recall to the Firefighter’s former position shall be given to the Firefighter in writing at
his or her last known post office address, it being the Firefighter’s obligation to notify the district
of any change in address while laid off, or reduced in rank. The notice shall be by certified mail,
return receipt requested. The Firefighter shall be given 15 days to accept an offer of
reinstatement, in which case written acceptance shall be sufficient if filed in any form with the
district.

21.1.16 Any Firefighter who is reduced in rank, pursuant to this Article, and is on a promotional list when
demoted shall remain on the list and remain eligible for promotion until the list expires, subject
to the recall or reinstatement rights of any laid off or demoted Firefighter, under the terms of
this Article.

21.1.17 The provisions of this Article shall govern to determine the rights of any Firefighter who is
demoted or laid off on or after January 1, 2025.



Tentative Agreement
This Tentative Agreement (TA) represents the full and complete understanding reached

between the parties listed below on the matters contained herein. This agreement is subject to
ratification by the Union Local 5389 membership and approval by the WFPD Board of Directors.

FOR THE DISTRICT

Rick Bollinger, President

FOR THE UNION LOCAL 5389

Nick Schneeberger, President

October 2025



